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Deuteronomy

Chapter 1
1 These are the words that Moses spoke to
all Israel beyond the Jordan in the wilder-
ness, in the plain of the Jordan River val-
ley over against Suph, between Paran,
Tophel, Laban, Hazeroth, and Di Zahab. 2

It is eleven days’ journey from Horeb by
the way of Mount Seir to Kadesh Barnea.
3 It happened in the fortieth year, in the
eleventh month, on the first day of the
month, that Moses spoke to the people of
Israel, telling them all that Yahweh com-
manded him concerning them. 4 This was
after Yahweh had attacked Sihon the king
of the Amorites, who lived in Heshbon,
and Og the king of Bashan, who lived in
Ashtaroth at Edrei. 5 Beyond the Jordan,
in the land of Moab, Moses began to an-
nounce these instructions, saying, 6 ”Yah-
weh our God spoke to us at Horeb, say-
ing, ’You have lived long enough in this
hill country. 7 Turn and take your jour-
ney, and go to the hill country of the Amor-
ites and to all the places near there in the
plain of the Jordan River valley, in the hill
country, in the lowland, in the Negev, and
by the seashore—the land of the Canaan-
ites, and in Lebanon as far as the great
river, the Euphrates. 8 Look, I have set
the land before you; go in and possess the
land that Yahweh swore to your fathers—
to Abraham, to Isaac, and to Jacob—to
give to them and to their descendants af-
ter them.’
9 I spoke to you at that time, saying, ’I
am not able to carry you myself alone.
10 Yahweh your God has multiplied you,
and, look, you are today as the multitude
of the stars of heaven. 11 May Yahweh,
the God of your fathers, make you a thou-
sand times as many as you are, and bless

you, as he has promised you! 12 But
how can I myself alone carry your loads,
your burdens, and your disputes? 13 Take
wise men, understanding men, and men
of good repute from each tribe, and I will
make them heads over you.’ 14 You an-
swered me and said, ‘The thing that you
have spoken is good for us to do.’ 15

So I took the heads of your tribes, wise
men, and men of good repute, and made
them heads over you, captains of thou-
sands, captains of hundreds, captains of
fifties, captains of tens, and officers, tribe
by tribe. 16 I commanded your judges
at that time, saying, ’Hear the disputes
between your brothers, and judge righ-
teously between a man and his brother,
and the foreigner who is with him. 17

You will not show partiality to anyone in
a dispute; you will hear the small and the
great alike. You will not be afraid of the
face ofman, for the judgment is God’s. The
dispute that is too hard for you, you will
bring to me, and I will hear it.’ 18 I com-
manded you at that time all the things that
you should do.

19 We journeyed away from Horeb and
went through all that great and terrible
wilderness that you saw, on ourway to the
hill country of the Amorites, as Yahweh
ourGodhad commandedus; andwe came
to Kadesh Barnea. 20 I said to you, ’You
have come to the hill country of the Amor-
ites, which Yahweh our God is giving to
us. 21 Look, Yahweh your God has set the
land before you; go up, take possession, as
Yahweh, the God of your fathers, has spo-
ken to you; do not be afraid, neither be
discouraged.’ 22 Every one of you came
to me and said, ‘Let us send men ahead of
us, so that they may search out the land
for us, and bring us word about the way
by which we should attack, and about the
cities to which we will come.’ 23 The ad-
vice pleased me well; I took twelve men
of you, one man for every tribe. 24 They
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turned and went up into the hill country,
came to the Valley of Eshcol, and scouted
it. 25 They took some of the produce of the
land in their hands and brought it down
to us. They also brought us word and said,
‘It is a good land that Yahweh our God is
giving to us.’

26 Yet you refused to attack, but rebelled
against the commandment of Yahweh
your God. 27 You complained in your tents
and said, ”It is because Yahweh hated us
that he has brought us out of the land of
Egypt, to give us into the handof theAmor-
ites to destroy us. 28 Where can we go
now? Our brothers have made our heart
to melt, saying, ‘Those people are bigger
and taller than we are; their cities are
large and are fortified up to the heavens;
moreover, we have seen the sons of the
Anakim there.’” 29 Then I said to you, ’Do
not be terrified, neither be afraid of them.
30 Yahweh your God, who goes before you,
he will fight for you, like everything that
he did for you in Egypt before your eyes,
31 and also in the wilderness, where you
have seen how Yahweh your God carried
you, as a man carries his son, everywhere
you went until you came to this place.’ 32

Yet in spite of this word you did not be-
lieve Yahweh your God, 33 who went be-
fore you on the way to find a place for you
to make camp, in fire by night and in a
cloud by day.

34 Yahweh heard the sound of your words
and was angry; he swore and said, 35

’Surely not one of these men of this evil
generation will see the good land that I
swore to give to your ancestors, 36 save
Caleb son of Jephunneh; he will see it. To
him Iwill give the land that he has stepped
on, and to his children, because he has
wholly followed Yahweh.’ 37 Also Yahweh
was angry withme because of you, saying,
’You also will not go in there; 38 Joshua son
of Nun, who stands before you, he will go

in there; encourage him, for he will lead
Israel to inherit it. 39 Moreover, your lit-
tle children, the ones you said would be
victims, who today have no knowledge of
good or evil—they will go in there. To
them I will give it, and they will possess
it. 40 But as for you, turn and take your
journey into the wilderness along the way
to the Sea of Reeds.’
41 Then you answered and said to me, ‘We
have sinned against Yahweh; we will go
up and fight, and we will follow all that
Yahweh our God has commanded us to
do.’ Every man among you put on his
weapons of war, and you were ready to
attack the hill country. 42 Yahweh said to
me, ‘Say to them, ”Do not attack and do
not fight, for I will not be with you, and
you will be defeated by your enemies.’ 43

I spoke to you in this way, but you did
not listen. You rebelled against the com-
mandment of Yahweh; you were arrogant
and attacked the hill country. 44 But the
Amorites, who lived in that hill country,
came out against you and chased you like
bees, and struck you down in Seir, as far
as Hormah. 45 You returned and wept be-
fore Yahweh; but Yahweh did not listen to
your voice, nor did he pay attention to you.
46 So you stayed in Kadesh many days, all
the days that you stayed there.

Chapter 2
1 Then we turned and took our journey
into the wilderness by the way to the Sea
of Reeds, as Yahweh had spoken tome; we
went around Mount Seir for many days. 2
Yahweh spoke to me, saying, 3 ’You have
gone around this mountain long enough;
turn northward. 4 Command the people,
saying, ”You are to pass through the bor-
der of your brothers, the descendants of
Esau, who live in Seir; they will be afraid
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of you. Therefore be careful 5 not to fight
with them, for I will not give you any of
their land, no, not even enough for the
sole of a foot to step on; for I have given
Mount Seir to Esau as a possession. 6 You
will purchase food from them for money,
so that you may eat; you will also buy
water from them for money, so that you
may drink. 7 For Yahweh your God has
blessed you in all the work of your hand;
he has known your walking through this
great wilderness. For these forty years
Yahweh your God has been with you, and
you have lacked nothing.”’ 8 So we passed
by our brothers, the descendants of Esau
who live in Seir, away from the Arabah
road, from Elath and from Ezion Geber.
Then we turned and passed by the way
of the wilderness of Moab. 9 Yahweh
said to me, ‘Do not trouble Moab, and do
not fight with them in battle. For I will
not give you his land for your own pos-
session, because I have given Ar to the de-
scendants of Lot, for their possession.’ 10

(The Emim lived there previously, a peo-
ple as great, as many, and as tall as the
Anakim; 11 these also are considered to
be the Rephaim, like the Anakim; but the
Moabites call them the Emim. 12 The
Horites also lived in Seir previously, but
the descendants of Esau succeeded them.
They destroyed them from before them
and lived in their place, like Israel did to
the land of his possession that Yahweh
gave to them.) 13 ”‘Now rise up and go
over the brook Zered.’ So we went over
the brook Zered. 14 Now the days from
when we came from Kadesh Barnea until
we crossed the brook Zered, were thirty-
eight years. It was by that time that all
that generation of the men fit for fight-
ingwere gone from the people, as Yahweh
had sworn to them. 15 Moreover, the hand
of Yahweh was against that generation in
order to destroy them from the people un-
til they were gone.

16 So it happened, when all the men fit for
fighting were dead and gone from among
the people, 17 that Yahweh spoke to me,
saying, 18 ’You are today to pass over Ar,
the border of Moab. 19 When you come
near opposite the people of Ammon, do
not trouble them or fight them; for I will
not give you any of the land of the peo-
ple of Ammon as a possession; because
I have given it to the descendants of Lot
as a possession.’” 20 (That also is consid-
ered to be a land of the Rephaim. The
Rephaim lived there previously—but the
Ammonites call them Zamzummim— 21 a
people as great, as many, and as tall as the
Anakim. But Yahweh destroyed them be-
fore the Ammonites, and they succeeded
them and lived in their place. 22 This Yah-
weh also did for the people of Esau, who
live in Seir, when he destroyed theHorites
from before them, and the descendants of
Esau succeeded them and have lived in
their place even until today. 23 As for the
Avviteswho lived in villages as far asGaza,
the Caphtorim, who came from Caphtor,
destroyed them and settled in their place.)
24 ”’Now rise up, go on your journey, and
pass over the Valley of the Arnon; look,
I have given into your hand Sihon the
Amorite, king of Heshbon, and his land.
Begin to possess it, and fight with him in
battle. 25 Today I will begin to put the fear
and terror of you on the peoples that are
under the whole sky; they will hear news
about you and will tremble and be in an-
guish because of you.’

26 I sent messengers from the wilderness
of Kedemoth to Sihon, king of Heshbon,
with words of peace, saying, 27 ’Let me
pass through your land; I will go along the
highway; I will turn neither to the right
hand nor to the left. 28 You will sell me
food for money, so that I may eat; give me
water for money, so that I may drink; only
let me pass through on my feet; 29 as the
descendants of Esau who live in Seir, and
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as the Moabites who live in Ar, did for me;
until I pass over the Jordan into the land
that Yahweh our God is giving us.’ 30 But
Sihon, king of Heshbon, would not let us
pass by him; for Yahweh your God had
hardened hismind andmade his heart ob-
stinate, that he might defeat him by your
might, which he has now done today. 31

Yahweh said to me, ‘Look, I have begun to
deliver up Sihon and his land before you;
begin to possess it, in order that you may
inherit his land.’ 32 Then Sihon came out
against us, he and all his people, to fight
at Jahaz. 33 Yahweh our God gave him
over to us andwe defeated him; we struck
him dead, his sons, and all his people. 34

We took all his cities at that time and com-
pletely destroyed every city—men and the
women and the little ones; we left no sur-
vivor. 35 Only the cattle we took as spoils
for ourselves, along with the spoil of the
cities that we had taken. 36 From Aroer,
which is on the edge of the Valley of the
Arnon, and from the city that is in the val-
ley, all the way to Gilead, there was not
a city too high for us. Yahweh our God
gave us victory over all our enemies be-
fore us. 37 It was only to the land of the
descendants of Ammon that you did not
go, as well as all the side of the Jabbok
River, and the cities of the hill country—
wherever Yahweh our God had forbidden
us to go.

Chapter 3
1 Then we turned and went up the way
to Bashan. Og, the king of Bashan, came
and attacked us, he and all his people, to
fight at Edrei. 2 Yahweh said to me, ‘Do
not fear him; for I have given you vic-
tory over him and have put all his peo-
ple and his land under your control. You
will do to him as you did to Sihon, king of
the Amorites, who lived at Heshbon.’ 3

So Yahweh our God also gave us victory
over Og the king of Bashan, and all his
people were put under our control. We
struck them down until not one of his peo-
ple remained. 4 We took all his cities at
that time; there was not one city that we
did not take from them: sixty cities—all
the region of Argob, the kingdom of Og in
Bashan. 5 These were all cities fortified
with high walls, gates, and bars; this was
besides very many unwalled villages. 6

We completely destroyed them, as we did
to Sihon king of Heshbon, completely de-
stroying every city—men and the women
and the little ones. 7 But all the cattle and
the spoil of the cities, we took as spoils for
ourselves. 8 At that time we took the land
out of the hand of the two kings of the
Amorites, who were beyond the Jordan,
from theValley of theArnon toMountHer-
mon 9 (Mount Hermon the Sidonians call
Sirion, and the Amorites call it Senir) 10

and all the cities of the plain, all Gilead,
and all Bashan, all the way to Salecah
and Edrei, cities of the kingdom of Og in
Bashan.” 11 (For of the remnant of the
Rephaim, only Og king of Bashan had re-
mained. Look! His bed was a bed of iron.
Was it not in Rabbah, where the descen-
dants of Ammon live? It was nine cubits
long and four cubits wide, the way people
measure.)

12 ”This land that we took in possession at
that time—from Aroer, that is by the Val-
ley of the Arnon, and half the hill coun-
try of Gilead, and its cities—I gave to the
Reubenites and to the Gadites. 13 The
rest of Gilead and all Bashan, the king-
dom of Og, I gave to the half tribe of Man-
asseh: all the region of Argob, and all
Bashan. (The same territory is called the
land of Rephaim. 14 Jair, a descendant
of Manasseh, took all the region of Argob
to the border of the Geshurites and the
Maacathites. He called the region, even
Bashan, by his own name, Havvoth Jair, to
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this day.) 15 I gave Gilead to Machir. 16 To
the Reubenites and to the Gadites I gave
territory from Gilead to the Valley of the
Arnon—the middle of the valley is the ter-
ritory’s border—and to the Jabbok River,
which is the border with the descendants
of Ammon. 17 Another of its borders is
also the plain of the Jordan River valley,
from Chinnereth to the Sea of the Arabah
(that is, the Salt Sea) to the slopes ofMount
Pisgah eastward.

18 I commanded you at that time, saying,
’Yahweh your God has given you this land
to possess it; you, all the men of war, will
pass over armed before your brothers, the
people of Israel. 19 But your wives, your
little ones, and your cattle (I know that
you have much cattle), will stay in your
cities that I have given you, 20 until Yah-
weh gives rest to your brothers, as he has
to you, until they also possess the land that
Yahweh your God is giving them beyond
the Jordan; then will you return, every
man of you, to your own property that I
have given you.’ 21 I commanded Joshua
at that time, saying, ’Your eyes have seen
all that Yahweh your God has done to
these two kings; Yahweh will do the same
to all the kingdoms where you go over. 22

You will not fear them, for Yahweh your
God is the one who will fight for you.’

23 I implored Yahweh at that time, say-
ing, 24 ’O Lord Yahweh, you have begun
to show your servant your greatness and
your strong hand; for what god is there in
heaven or in earth that can do the same
works as you have done, and the same
mighty acts? 25 Let me go over, I beg you,
and see the good land that is beyond the
Jordan, that good hill country, and also
Lebanon.’ 26 But Yahweh was angry with
me because of you; he did not listen to me.
Yahweh said tome, ’Let this be enough for
you—speak nomore to me about this mat-
ter: 27 go up to the top of Pisgah and lift

up your eyeswestward, northward, south-
ward, and eastward; look with your eyes,
for you will not go over the Jordan. 28 In-
stead, instruct Joshua and encourage and
strengthen him, for he will go over before
this people, and he will cause them to in-
herit the land that you will see.’ 29 So we
stayed in the valley opposite Beth Peor.

Chapter 4
1 Now, Israel, listen to the laws and the de-
crees that I am about to teach you, to do
them; so that you may live and go in and
possess the land that Yahweh, the God of
your fathers, is giving you. 2 You will not
add to the words that I command you, nei-
ther will you diminish them, so that you
may keep the commandments of Yahweh
your God that I am about to command
you. 3 Your eyes have seen what Yahweh
did because of Baal Peor; for all the men
who followed the Baal of Peor, Yahweh
your God has destroyed them fromamong
you. 4 But you who clung to Yahweh your
God are alive today, every one of you. 5

Look, I have taught you laws and decrees,
as Yahweh my God had commanded me,
that you should do so in the midst of the
land which you are going into in order to
possess it. 6 Therefore keep them and do
them; for this is your wisdom and your
understanding in the sight of the peoples
who will hear about all these statutes and
say, ‘Surely this great nation is a wise and
understanding people.’ 7 For what other
great nation is there that has a god so near
to them, as Yahweh our God is whenever
we call upon him? 8 What other great na-
tion is there that has laws and decrees so
righteous as all this law that I am setting
before you today?
9 Only pay attention and carefully guard
yourself, so that you do not forget the
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things that your eyes have seen, so that
they do not leave your heart for all the
days of your life. Instead, make them
known to your children and your chil-
dren’s children. 10 On the day that you
stood before Yahweh your God at Horeb,
when Yahweh said to me, ‘Assemble me
the people, and I will make them hear my
words, that they may learn to fear me all
the days that they live on the earth, and
that they may teach their children.’ 11

You came near and stood at the foot of
themountain. Themountain burnedwith
fire to the heart of heaven, with darkness,
cloud, and thick darkness. 12 Yahweh
spoke to you out of the middle of the fire;
you heard the voice with its words, but
you saw no form; you only heard a voice.
13 He declared to you his covenant that
he commanded you to perform, the Ten
Commandments. He wrote them on two
tablets of stone. 14 Yahweh commanded
me at that time to teach you statutes and
ordinances, so that you might do them in
the land that you are crossing over to take
possession of.

15 So take great heed to yourselves—for
you saw no kind of form on the day that
Yahweh spoke to you at Horeb out of the
middle of the fire— 16 that you do not cor-
rupt yourselves and make a carved figure
in the likeness of any creature, the form
of amale or a female person, 17 or the like-
ness of any beast that is on the earth, or
the likeness of any winged bird that flies
in the heavens, 18 or the likeness of any-
thing that creeps on the ground, or the
likeness of any fish that is in the water un-
der the earth. 19 You shall not lift your
eyes up to the heavens and look at the
sun, themoon, or the stars—all the host of
the heavens—and be drawn away to wor-
ship them and adore them—those things
of which Yahweh your God has given a
share all the peoples under the whole sky.
20 But Yahweh has taken you and brought

you out of the iron furnace, out of Egypt,
to be to him a people of his own inheri-
tance, as you are today. 21 Yahweh was
angry with me because of you; he swore
that I should not go over the Jordan, and
that I should not go into that good land,
the land that Yahweh your God is giving
to you as an inheritance. 22 Instead, Imust
die in this land; I must not go over the Jor-
dan; but you will go over and possess that
good land. 23 Pay attention to yourselves,
so that you do not forget the covenant of
Yahweh your God, which he made with
you, andmake for yourselves a carved im-
age in the form of anything that Yahweh
your God has forbidden you to make. 24

For Yahweh your God is a devouring fire,
a jealous God.

25 When you beget children and children’s
children, and when you will have been in
the land for a long time, and if you cor-
rupt yourselves and make a carved figure
in the form of anything, and do what is
evil in the sight of Yahweh your God, to
provoke him to anger— 26 I call heaven
and earth to witness against you today
that you will soon utterly perish from off
the land that you are going over the Jor-
dan to possess; you will not prolong your
days in it, but you will be completely de-
stroyed. 27 Yahweh will scatter you
among the peoples, and you will be left
few in number among the nations, where
Yahweh will lead you away. 28 There you
will serve other gods, the work of men’s
hands, wood and stone, which neither see,
hear, eat, nor smell. 29 But from there
you will seek Yahweh your God, and you
will find him, when you search after him
with all your heart and with all your soul.
30 When you are in distress, and when
all these things will have come on you, in
those later days youwill return to Yahweh
yourGod and listen to his voice. 31 For Yah-
weh your God is a merciful God; he will
not fail you nor destroy you, nor forget the
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covenant of your fathers that he swore to
them.

32 For ask nowabout the days that are past,
which were before you: since the day that
God created man on the earth, and from
the one end of heaven to the other, ask
whether there has been anything like this
great thing, or has anything like it ever
been heard? 33 Did ever a people hear the
voice of God speaking out of the midst of
thefire, as youhaveheard, and live? 34Or
has God ever attempted to go and take for
himself a nation from themidst of another
nation, by trials, by signs, and bywonders,
and by war, and by amighty hand, and by
an outstretched arm, and by great terrors,
as everything that Yahweh your God did
for you in Egypt before your eyes? 35 To
you these things were shown, so that you
might know that Yahweh is God, and that
there is no one else besides him. 36 Out
of heaven he made you to hear his voice,
so that he might instruct you; on earth he
made you see his great fire; you heard his
words out of the midst of the fire. 37 Be-
cause he loved your fathers, he chose their
descendants after them, and brought you
out of Egypt with his presence, with his
great power; 38 in order to drive out from
before you nations greater and mightier
than you, to bring you in, to give you their
land as an inheritance, as today. 39 Know
therefore today, and lay it on your heart,
that Yahweh is God in heaven above and
on the earth beneath; there is no one else.
40 You will keep his statutes and his com-
mandments that I command you today,
that it may gowell with you andwith your
children after you, and that you may pro-
long your days in the land that Yahweh
your God is giving you forever.”

41 Then Moses selected three cities on the
east side of the Jordan, 42 so that any-
one might flee to one of them if he killed
another person accidentally, without be-

ing his enemy previously. By fleeing to
one of these cities, he might survive. 43

They were: Bezer in the wilderness, the
plain country, for the Reubenites; Ramoth
in Gilead, for the Gadites; and Golan in
Bashan, for the Manassites.
44 This is the law that Moses placed be-
fore the people of Israel; 45 these are the
covenant decrees, laws, and other decrees
that he spoke to the people of Israel when
they came out of Egypt, 46 when theywere
east of the Jordan, in the valley opposite
Beth Peor, in the land of Sihon, king of
the Amorites, who had lived at Heshbon,
whom Moses and the people of Israel had
defeated when they came out of Egypt. 47

They took his land as a possession, and
the land of Og king of Bashan—these, the
two kings of the Amorites, who were be-
yond the Jordan toward the east. 48 This
territory went from Aroer, on the edge
of the Valley of the Arnon, to Mount Sion
(or Mount Hermon), 49 and included all of
the plain of the Jordan River valley, east-
ward beyond the Jordan, to the Sea of the
Arabah, to the slopes of Mount Pisgah.

Chapter 5
1 Moses called to all Israel and said to
them, ”Listen, Israel, to the statutes and
the decrees that I will speak in your ears
today, that you may learn them and keep
them. 2 Yahweh our Godmade a covenant
with us at Horeb. 3 Yahweh did not make
this covenantwith our ancestors, butwith
us, all of us alive here today. 4 Yahweh
spoke with you face to face on the mount
out of the middle of the fire 5 (I stood be-
tween Yahweh and you at that time, to re-
veal to you his word; for you were afraid
because of the fire, and you did not go up
the mountain). Yahweh said,
6 ’I am Yahweh your God, who brought
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you out of the land of Egypt, out of the
house of slavery.
7 You will have no other gods before me.
8 You will not make for yourself a carved
figure nor any likeness of anything that is
in heaven above, or that is in the earth be-
neath, or that is in the water below. 9 You
will not bow down to them or serve them,
for I, Yahweh your God, am a jealous
God. I punish the ancestors’ wickedness
by bringing punishment on the children,
to the third and fourth generation of those
who hate me, 10 and showing covenant
faithfulness to thousands, to those who
love me and keep my commandments.
11 You will not take the name of Yahweh
your God in vain, for Yahwehwill not hold
him guiltless that takes his name in vain.
12 Observe the Sabbath day to keep it holy,
as Yahweh your God commanded you. 13

For six days you will labor and do all
your work; 14 but the seventh day is a
Sabbath to Yahweh your God. On it you
will not do any work—not you, nor your
son, nor your daughter, nor yourmale ser-
vant, nor your female servant, nor your
ox, nor your donkey, nor any of your cat-
tle, nor any foreigner who is within your
gates. This is so that your male servant
and your female servant may rest as well
as you. 15 You will call to mind that you
were a servant in the land of Egypt, and
Yahweh your God brought you out from
there by a mighty hand and by an out-
stretched arm. Therefore Yahweh your
God has commanded you to keep the Sab-
bath day.
16 Honor your father and your mother, as
Yahweh your God has commanded you to
do, that you may live a long time in the
land that Yahweh your God gives you, and
so that it may go well with you.
17 You will not murder.
18 You will not commit adultery.

19 You will not steal.
20 You will not give false witness against
your neighbor.
21 You will not covet your neighbor’s wife,
you will not covet your neighbor’s house,
his field, or hismale servant, or his female
servant, his ox, or his donkey, or anything
that belongs to your neighbor.’
22 These words Yahweh spoke in a loud
voice to all your assembly on the moun-
tain out of the middle of the fire, of the
cloud, and of the thick darkness; he did
not add any more words. He wrote them
down on two tablets of stone and gave
them to me. 23 It came about, when you
heard the voice out of the middle of the
darkness, while the mountain was burn-
ing, that you came near to me—all your
elders and the heads of your tribes. 24 You
said, ’Look, Yahweh our God has shownus
his glory and his greatness, and we have
heard his voice out of the middle of the
fire; we have seen today that when God
speaks with people, they can live. 25 But
why should we die? For this great fire
will consume us; if we hear the voice of
Yahweh our God any longer, we will die.
26 For who besides us is there among all
flesh who has heard the voice of the liv-
ing God speak out of the middle of the
fire and lived, as we have done? 27 As
for you, you should go and listen to every-
thing that Yahweh our God says; repeat to
us everything that Yahweh our God says
to you; we will listen to it and obey it.’
28 Yahweh heard your words when you
spoke to me. He said to me, ’I have heard
the words of this people, what they said
to you. What they said was good. 29 Oh,
that there were such a heart in them, that
they would honor me and always keep
all my commandments, that it might go
wellwith themandwith their children for-
ever! 30 Go say to them, “Return to your
tents.” 31 But as for you, stand here byme,
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and I will tell you all the commandments,
the statutes, and the decrees that you will
teach them, so that theymay keep them in
the land that I will give them to possess.’
32 You will keep, therefore, what Yahweh
your God has commanded you; you will
not turn aside to the right hand or to the
left. 33 You will walk in all the ways that
Yahweh your God has commanded you, so
that you may live, and so that it may go
well with you, and that you may prolong
your days in the land that you will pos-
sess.

Chapter 6
1 Now these are the commandments,
statutes, and decrees that Yahweh your
God has commanded me to teach you, so
that you might keep them in the land that
you are going over the Jordan to possess;
2 so that you might honor Yahweh your
God, so as to keep all his statutes and com-
mandments that I am commanding you—
you, your sons, and your sons’ sons, all
the days of your lives, so that your days
may be prolonged. 3 Therefore listen to
them, Israel, and keep them, so that it may
go well with you, so that you may greatly
multiply, in a land flowing with milk and
honey, as Yahweh, the God of your fathers,
has promised you would do.
4 Listen, Israel: Yahweh our God is one. 5

You will love Yahweh your God with all
your heart, with all your soul, andwith all
your might. 6 The words that I am com-
manding you todaywill be in your heart; 7
and you will diligently teach them to your
children; you will talk about them when
you sit in your house, when you walk on
the road, when you lie down, and when
you get up. 8 You will tie them as a sign
upon your hand, and they will serve as
frontlets between your eyes. 9 You will

write themon the doorposts of your house
and on your gates.
10 When Yahweh your God brings you into
the land that he swore to your fathers, to
Abraham, to Isaac, and to Jacob, that he
would give you, with large and very good
cities that you did not build, 11 and houses
full of all kinds of good things that you
did notmake, cisterns that you did not dig,
and vineyards and olive trees that you did
not plant, you will eat and be satisfied—
12 then be careful so that you do not for-
get Yahweh, who brought you out of the
land of Egypt, out of the house of bondage.
13 You will honor Yahweh your God; him
you will worship, and you will swear by
his name. 14 You will not go after other
gods, the gods of the peoples who are all
around you— 15 for Yahweh your God in
the midst of you is a jealous God—if you
do, the anger of Yahweh your God will be
kindled against you and he will destroy
you from the surface of the earth.
16 You will not test Yahweh your God as
you tested him at Massah. 17 You will dili-
gently keep the commandments of Yah-
weh your God, his solemn commands, and
his statutes, that he has commanded you.
18 Youwill dowhat is right and good in the
sight of Yahweh, that it may go well with
you, and that you may go in and possess
the good land that Yahweh swore to your
fathers, 19 to drive out all your enemies
from before you, as Yahweh has said.
20 When your son asks you in time to
come, saying, ‘What are the covenant de-
crees, the statutes, and the other decrees
that Yahweh our God commanded you?’
21 then you will say to your son, ’We
were Pharaoh’s slaves in Egypt; Yahweh
brought us out of Egypt with a mighty
hand, 22 and he displayed signs and won-
ders, great and severe, on Egypt, on
Pharaoh, and on all his house, before our
eyes; 23 and he brought us out from there,
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so that he might bring us in, to give us
the land that he swore to our fathers. 24

Yahweh commanded us to always keep all
these statutes, to fear Yahweh our God for
our good, so that hemight keep us alive, as
we are today. 25 If we keep all these com-
mands before Yahweh our God, as he has
commanded us, this will be our righteous-
ness.’

Chapter 7
1 When Yahweh your God brings you
into the land that you go to possess, he
will drive out many nations before you—
the Hittites, the Girgashites, the Amorites,
the Canaanites, the Perizzites, the Hivites,
and the Jebusites—seven nations greater
and mightier than you. 2 It is Yahweh
your God who gives them over to you
when you defeat them, and then youmust
completely destroy them. You will make
no covenant with them, and show them
no mercy. 3 Neither will you arrange any
marriages with them. You will not give
your daughters to their sons, and you will
not take their daughters for your sons. 4

For they will turn away your sons from
following me, so that they may worship
other gods. So the anger of Yahwehwill be
kindled against you, and he will destroy
you quickly. 5 This is how you will deal
with them: you will break down their al-
tars, dash their stone pillars in pieces, cut
down their Asherah poles, and burn their
cast idols.
6 For you are a nation that is set apart to
Yahweh your God. He has chosen you to
be a people for him to possess, more than
all the other peoples that are on the face of
the earth. 7 Yahweh did not set his love
upon you or choose you because youwere
more in number than anypeople—for you
were the fewest of all peoples— 8 but be-
cause he loves you, and he wished to keep

the oath that he had sworn to your fathers.
This is why Yahweh has brought you out
with amighty hand and redeemed you out
of the house of bondage, from the hand
of Pharaoh, king of Egypt. 9 Therefore
know that Yahweh your God—he is God,
the faithful God, whokeeps covenants and
faithfulness for a thousand generations
with thosewho love himandkeephis com-
mandments, 10 but repays those who hate
him to their face, to destroy them; he will
not be lenient on whoever hates him; he
will repay him to his face. 11 You will
therefore keep the commandments, the
statutes, and the decrees that I command
you today, so that you will do them.

12 If you listen to these decrees, and keep
and do them, it will happen that Yahweh
your God will keep with you the covenant
and the faithfulness that he swore to your
fathers. 13 He will love you, bless you, and
multiply you; he will also bless the fruit
of your body and the fruit of your ground,
your grain, your new wine, and your oil,
the multiplication of your cattle and the
young of your flocks, in the land that he
swore to your fathers to give you. 14 You
will be blessed more than all other peo-
ples; therewill not be a childlessmale or a
barren female among you or among your
cattle. 15 Yahweh will take away from you
all sickness; none of the evil diseases of
Egypt that you have known will he put on
you, but he will put them on all those who
hate you. 16 You will consume all the peo-
ple groups over which Yahweh your God
gives you victory, and your eye will not
pity them. Youwill notworship their gods,
for that will be a trap for you.

17 If you say in your heart, ‘These na-
tions are more numerous than I; how can
I dispossess them?’— 18 do not be afraid
of them; you will call to mind what Yah-
weh your God did to Pharaoh and to all
Egypt; 19 the great sufferings that your
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eyes saw, the signs, the wonders, the
mighty hand, and the outstretched arm
by which Yahweh your God brought you
out. Yahweh your God will do the same
to all the peoples whom you fear. 20

Moreover, Yahweh your God will send
the hornet among them, until those who
are left and who hide themselves from
you perish from your presence. 21 You
will not be frightened at them, for Yah-
weh your God is among you, a great and
fearsome God. 22 Yahweh your God will
drive out those nations before you little
by little. You will not defeat them all at
once, or the wild animals would become
very many around you. 23 But Yah-
weh your God will give you victory over
them when you meet them in battle; he
will greatly confuse them until they are
destroyed. 24 He will put their kings un-
der your power, and you will make their
name perish from under heaven. No one
will be able to stand before you, until you
have destroyed them. 25 You will burn
the carved figures of their gods—do not
covet the silver or the gold that covers
them and take it for yourself, because if
you do, you will become trapped by it—
for it is an abomination to Yahweh your
God. 26 You will not bring any abomina-
tion into your house and start to worship
it. You will utterly detest and abhor it, for
it is set apart for destruction.

Chapter 8
1 You must keep all the commands that
I am giving you today, so that you may
live and multiply, and go in and possess
the land that Yahweh swore to your fa-
thers. 2 You will call to mind all the ways
that Yahweh your God has led you these
forty years in the wilderness, in order
that he might humble you, that he might
test you to know what was in your heart,

as to whether you would keep his com-
mandments or not. 3 He humbled you,
and made you hunger, and fed you with
manna, which you had not known and
which your fathers had not known. He
did that to make you know that it is not
by bread alone that people live; rather, it
is by everything that proceeds out of the
mouth of Yahweh that people live. 4

Your clothing did not wear out and fall off
you, and your feet did not swell up during
those forty years. 5 Youwill think about in
your heart, how, as a man disciplines his
son, so Yahweh your God disciplines you.
6 Youwill keep the commandments of Yah-
weh your God, so that you might walk in
his ways and honor him. 7 For Yahweh
your God is bringing you into a good land,
a land of brooks of water, of fountains
and springs, flowing out into valleys and
among hills; 8 a land of wheat and bar-
ley, of vines, fig trees, and pomegranates;
a land of olive trees and honey. 9 It is a
land in which you will eat bread without
lack, and where you will not go without
anything; a land whose stones are made
of iron, and out of whose hills youmay dig
copper. 10 Youwill eat and be full, and you
will bless Yahweh your God for the good
land that he has given you.

11 Be careful that you do not forget Yah-
weh your God, and that you do not neglect
his commandments, his ordinances, and
his statutes that I am commanding you to-
day, 12 otherwise, when you eat and are
full, and when you build good houses and
live in them, your heart will be lifted up.
13 Be careful when your herds and flocks
multiply and when your silver and gold
increase, and all that you have is multi-
plied, 14 then your heart becomes lifted
up and you forget Yahweh your God, who
brought you out of the land of Egypt, out
of the house of bondage. 15 Do not for-
get himwho led you through the great and
terrifying wilderness, with its fiery ser-
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pents and scorpions and thirsty ground
where there was no water, who brought
you water out of the rock of flint. 16 He
fed you in thewildernesswithmanna that
your ancestors had never known, so that
he might humble you and test you, to do
you good in the end, 17 but you may say
in your heart, ‘My power and the might of
my hand acquired all this wealth.’ 18 But
you will call to mind Yahweh your God,
for it is he who gives you the power to get
wealth; that hemay establish his covenant
that he swore to your fathers, as it is today.
19 Itwill happen that, if youwill forget Yah-
weh your God and walk after other gods,
worship them, and reverence them, I tes-
tify against you today that you will surely
perish. 20 Like the nations that Yahweh is
making to perish before you, so will you
perish, because you would not listen to
the voice of Yahweh your God.

Chapter 9
1 Hear, Israel; you are about to cross over
the Jordan today, to go in to dispossess na-
tions greater and mightier than yourself,
and cities that are great and fortified up to
heaven, 2 a people great and tall, the sons
of the Anakim, whom you know, and of
whom you have heard people say, ‘Who
can stand before the sons of Anak?’ 3

Know therefore today that Yahweh your
God is he who goes over before you like a
devouring fire; he will destroy them, and
he will subdue them before you; so will
you drive them out andmake them to per-
ish quickly, as Yahweh has said to you. 4

Do not say in your heart, after Yahweh
your God has thrust them out from before
you, ‘It was because of my righteousness
that Yahweh has brought me in to possess
this land,’ for it was because of thewicked-
ness of these nations that Yahweh is driv-
ing them out from before you. 5 It is not

because of your righteousness or the up-
rightness of your heart that you are going
in to possess their land, but it is because of
the wickedness of these nations that your
God is driving them out from before you,
and so that he may make come true the
word that he swore to your ancestors, to
Abraham, Isaac, and Jacob.

6 Know therefore, that Yahweh your God
is not giving you this good land to possess
because of your righteousness, for you are
a stubborn people. 7 Remember and
do not forget how you provoked Yahweh
your God to anger in the wilderness; from
the day that you left the land of Egypt
until you came to this place, you have
been rebellious against Yahweh. 8 Also
at Horeb you provoked Yahweh to anger,
and Yahweh was angry enough with you
to destroy you. 9 When I went up the
mountain to receive the tablets of stone,
the tablets of the covenant that Yahweh
made with you, I stayed on the mountain
for forty days and forty nights; I neither
ate bread nor drank water. 10 Yahweh
gave to me the two tablets of stone writ-
ten with his finger; on them was written
everything just like all the words that Yah-
weh announced to you on the mountain
out of the middle of the fire on the day of
the assembly. 11 It happened at the end
of those forty days and forty nights that
Yahweh gave me the two tablets of stone,
the tablets of the covenant. 12 Yahweh said
to me, ‘Arise, go down quickly from here,
for your people, whom you brought out of
Egypt, have corrupted themselves. They
have quickly turned aside out of the path
that I commanded them. They have made
for themselves a cast figure.’ 13 Further-
more, Yahweh spoke to me and said, ’I
have seen this people; they are a stubborn
people. 14 Let me alone, so that I may de-
stroy them and blot out their name from
under heaven, and I will make of you a na-
tion mightier and greater than they.’ 15
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So I turned around and came down the
mountain, and themountainwas burning.
The two tablets of the covenant were in
my hands. 16 I looked, and behold, you
had sinned against Yahweh your God. You
had molded for yourselves a calf. You
had quickly turned aside out of the path
that Yahweh had commanded you. 17 I
took the two tablets and threw them out
of my hands. I broke them before your
eyes. 18 Again I lay facedown before Yah-
weh for forty days and forty nights; I nei-
ther ate bread nor drank water, because
of all your sin that you had committed, in
doing that which was evil in the sight of
Yahweh, so as to provoke him to anger. 19

For I was afraid of the anger and hot dis-
pleasure with which Yahweh was angry
enough against you to destroy you. But
Yahweh listened to me that time also. 20

Yahweh was very angry with Aaron so as
to destroy him; I prayed for Aaron also at
the same time. 21 I took your sin, the calf
that you had made, and burned it, beat
it, and ground it very small, until it was
as fine as dust. I threw its dust into the
stream that came down from the moun-
tain.

22 At Taberah, at Massah, and at Ki-
broth Hattaavah, you provoked Yahweh
to wrath. 23 When Yahweh sent you from
Kadesh Barnea and said, ‘Go up and take
possession of the land that I have given
you,’ then you rebelled against the com-
mandment of Yahweh your God, and you
did not believe or listen to his voice. 24

You have been rebellious against Yahweh
from the day that I knew you.

25 So I lay facedown before Yahweh those
forty days and forty nights, because he
had said that he would destroy you. 26 I
prayed to Yahweh and said, ’O Lord Yah-
weh, do not destroy your people or your
inheritance whom you have redeemed
through your greatness, which you have

brought out of Egypt with a mighty hand.
27 Call to mind your servants Abraham,
Isaac, and Jacob; do not look at the
stubbornness of this people, nor at their
wickedness, nor at their sin, 28 so that the
land from where you brought us should
say, “Because Yahweh was not able to
bring them into the land that he promised
to them, and because he hated them, he
has brought them out to kill them in the
wilderness.” 29 Yet they are your people
and your inheritance, whom you brought
out by your great strength and by the dis-
play of your power.’

Chapter 10
1 At that time Yahweh said to me, ’Carve
two tablets of stone like thefirst, and come
up to me on the mountain, and make an
ark of wood. 2 I will write on the tablets
the words that were on the first tablets
that you broke, and you will put them in
the ark.’ 3 So I made an ark of acacia
wood, and I carved two tablets of stone
like the first, and I went up the mountain,
having the two tablets in my hand. 4 He
wrote on the tablets, like the first writ-
ing, the Ten Commandments which Yah-
weh had spoken to you on the mountain
out of the middle of the fire on the day of
the assembly; then Yahweh gave them to
me. 5 I turned and came down from the
mountain, and put the tablets in the ark
that I hadmade; there they are, as Yahweh
commanded me.” 6 (The people of Israel
journeyed from Beeroth Bene Jaakan to
Moserah. There Aaron died, and there he
was buried; Eleazar, his son, served in the
priest’s office in his place. 7 From there
they journeyed to Gudgodah, and from
Gudgodah to Jotbathah, a land of streams
of water. 8 At that time Yahweh chose
the tribe of Levi to carry the ark of the
covenant of Yahweh, to stand before Yah-
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weh to serve him, and to bless people in
his name, as today. 9 Therefore Levi has
no portion nor inheritance of land with
his brothers; Yahweh is his inheritance, as
Yahweh your God spoke to him.) 10 ”I
stayed on themountain as at the first time,
forty days and forty nights. Yahweh lis-
tened tome that time also; Yahwehdid not
wish to destroy you. 11 Yahweh said to me,
‘Arise, go before the people to lead them
on their journey; they will go in and pos-
sess the land that I swore to their ances-
tors to give to them.’

12 Now, Israel, what does Yahweh your
God require of you, except to fear Yahweh
your God, to walk in all his ways, to love
him, and to worship Yahweh your God
with all your heart and with all your soul,
13 to keep the commandments of Yahweh,
and his statutes, which I am commanding
you today for your own good? 14 Behold,
to Yahweh your God belongs heaven and
the heaven of heavens, the earth, with all
that is in them. 15 Only Yahweh took plea-
sure in your fathers so as to love them,
and he chose you, their descendants, af-
ter them, more than any of the other peo-
ples, as he does today. 16 Therefore cir-
cumcise the foreskin of your heart, and be
stubborn no longer. 17 For Yahweh your
God, he is God of gods andLord ofmasters,
the great God, themighty one and the fear-
some one, who favors no one and takes no
bribes. 18 He executes justice for the fa-
therless andwidow, and he shows love for
the foreigner by giving him food and cloth-
ing. 19 Therefore love the foreigner; for
you were foreigners in the land of Egypt.
20 You will fear Yahweh your God; him
will you worship. To him you must cling,
and by his name will you swear. 21 He
is your praise, and he is your God, who
has done for you these great and fearsome
things, which your eyes have seen. 22

Your fathers went down into Egypt as sev-
enty persons; now Yahweh your God has

made you asmany as the stars of the heav-
ens.

Chapter 11
1 Therefore you will love Yahweh your
God and always keep his instructions, his
statutes, his decrees, and his command-
ments. 2 Notice that I am not speaking
to your children, who have not knownnor
have they seen the punishment of Yahweh
your God, his greatness, his mighty hand,
or his outstretched arm, 3 the signs and
deeds that he did in the midst of Egypt
to Pharaoh, king of Egypt, and to all his
land. 4 Neither did they see what he did
to the army of Egypt, to their horses, or
to their chariots, how he made the water
of the Sea of Reeds overwhelm them as
they pursued after you, and how Yahweh
has destroyed them until today, 5 or what
he did for you in the wilderness until you
came to this place. 6 They had not seen
what Yahweh had done to Dathan and
Abiram, the sons of Eliab son of Reuben,
how the earth opened its mouth and swal-
lowed them up, their households, their
tents, and every living thing that followed
them, in themiddle of all Israel. 7 But your
eyes have seen all the great works of Yah-
weh that he did.
8 Therefore keep all the commandments
that I am commanding you today, that you
may be strong, and go in and possess the
land where you are going over to possess
it, 9 and that you may prolong your days
in the land that Yahweh swore to your fa-
thers to give to them and to their descen-
dants, a land flowingwithmilk and honey.
10 For the land, where you go in to pos-
sess it, is not like the land of Egypt, from
where you came, where you sowed your
seed and watered it with your foot, like
a garden of herbs; 11 but the land, where
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you go over to possess it, is a land of hills
and valleys, and drinks water of the rain
of the heavens, 12 a land that Yahweh your
God cares for; the eyes of Yahweh your
God are always upon it, from the begin-
ning of the year to the end of the year.

13 It will happen, if you will listen dili-
gently to my commandments that I com-
mand you today, to love Yahweh your God
and to serve him with all your heart and
with all your soul, 14 that I will give the
rain of your land in its season, the for-
mer rain and the latter rain, that you may
gather in your grain, your new wine, and
your oil. 15 I will give grass in your fields
for your cattle, and youwill eat and be full.
16 Pay attention to yourselves so that your
heart is not deceived, and you turn aside
and worship other gods and bow down to
them; 17 so that the anger of Yahweh is not
kindled against you; and so that he does
not shut up the heavens so that there will
be no rain, and the land will not yield its
fruit, and so that you perish quickly from
off the good land that Yahweh is giving
you.

18 Therefore lay up these words of mine in
your heart and soul, bind them as a sign
on your hand, and let them be as frontlets
between your eyes. 19 You will teach
them to your children and talk about them
when you sit in your house, when you
walk on the road, when you lie down, and
when you get up. 20 You will write them
on the doorposts of your house and on
your city gates, 21 that your days and the
days of your childrenmaybemultiplied in
the land that Yahweh swore to your ances-
tors to give them for as long as the heav-
ens are above the earth. 22 For if you dili-
gently keep all these commandments that
I am commanding you, so as to do them,
to love Yahweh your God, towalk in all his
ways, and to cling to him, 23 then Yahweh
will drive out all these nations from be-

fore you, and you will dispossess nations
larger and mightier than yourselves. 24

Every place where the sole of your foot
will tread will be yours; from the wilder-
ness to Lebanon, from the river, the Eu-
phrates River, to the western sea will be
your border. 25 No man will be able to
stand before you. Yahweh your God will
lay the fear of you and the terror of you
upon all the land that you tread on, as he
has said to you.
26 Look, I set before you today a blessing
and a curse: 27 the blessing, if you obey the
commandments of Yahweh your God that
I command you today, 28 and the curse,
if you do not obey the commandments of
Yahweh your God, but turn aside from the
way that I command you today, to go af-
ter other gods that you have not known.
29 It will happen, when Yahweh your God
brings you into the land which you go to
possess, that you will set the blessing on
Mount Gerizim, and the curse on Mount
Ebal. 30 Are they not beyond the Jordan,
west of thewestern road, in the land of the
Canaanites who live in the Arabah, over
against Gilgal, beside the oaks of Moreh?
31 For you are to cross over the Jordan to
go in to possess the land that Yahweh your
God is giving you, and you will possess
it and live in it. 32 You will keep all the
statutes and the decrees that I set before
you today.

Chapter 12
1 These are the statutes and the decrees
that you will keep in the land that Yah-
weh, the God of your fathers, has given
you to possess, all the days that you live
on the earth. 2 You will surely destroy all
the places where the nations that you will
dispossess worshiped their gods, on the
high mountains, on the hills, and under
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every green tree. 3 You must break down
their altars, dash in pieces their stone pil-
lars, and burn their Asherah poles. You
must cut down the carved figures of their
gods and destroy their name out of that
place. 4 You will not worship Yahweh
your God like that. 5 But to the place
that Yahweh your God will choose out
of all your tribes to put his name, that
will be the place where he lives, and it is
there that you will go. 6 It is there that
you will bring your burnt offerings, your
sacrifices, your tithes, and the offerings
presented by your hand, your offerings
for vows, your freewill offerings, and the
firstborn of your herds and flocks. 7

It is there that you will eat before Yah-
weh your God and rejoice about every-
thing that you have put your hand to, you
and your households, where Yahweh your
God has blessed you. 8 You will not do
all the things that we are doing here to-
day; now everyone is doing whatever is
right in his own eyes; 9 for you have not
yet come to the rest, to the inheritance
that Yahweh your God is giving you. 10

But when you go over the Jordan and live
in the land that Yahweh your God is caus-
ing you to inherit, and when he gives you
rest from all your enemies round about,
so that you live in safety, 11 then it will hap-
pen that to the place where Yahweh your
God will choose to cause his name to live,
there will you bring all that I command
you: your burnt offerings, your sacrifices,
your tithes, and the offerings presented by
your hand, and all your choice offerings
for vows that you will vow to Yahweh. 12

Youwill rejoice before YahwehyourGod—
you, your sons, your daughters, yourmale
servants, your female servants, and the
Levites who arewithin your gate, because
he has no portion or inheritance among
you. 13 Pay attention to yourself that
you do not offer your burnt offerings at
every place that you see; 14 but it is at

the place that Yahweh will choose among
one of your tribes that you will offer your
burnt offerings, and there you will do ev-
erything that I command you.

15 However, you may kill and eat animals
within all your gates, as you wish, receiv-
ing the blessing of Yahweh your God for
all that he has given you; the unclean and
the clean persons both may eat of it, ani-
mals such as the gazelle and the deer. 16

But you will not eat the blood; you will
pour it out on the earth like water. 17 You
may not eat within your gates from the
tithe of your grain, your new wine, your
oil, or the firstborn of your herd or flock;
and you may not eat any of the meat you
sacrifice along with any of your vows that
you make, nor that of your freewill offer-
ings, nor that of the offering you present
with your hand. 18 Instead, you will eat
thembefore YahwehyourGod in the place
that Yahweh your God will choose—you,
your son, your daughter, your male ser-
vant, your female servant, and the Levite
who is within your gates; you will re-
joice before Yahweh your God about ev-
erything to which you put your hand. 19

Pay attention to yourself so that you do
not forsake the Levite as long as you live
on your land.

20 When Yahweh your God enlarges your
borders, as he has promised you, and you
say, ‘I will eat flesh,’ because of your de-
sire to eatmeat, youmay eatmeat, as your
soul desires. 21 If the place that Yahweh
your God chooses to put his name is too
far from you, then you will kill some of
your herd and your flock that Yahweh has
given you, as I have commanded you; you
may eat within your gates, as your soul
desires. 22 Like the gazelle and the deer
are eaten, so you will eat of it; the un-
clean and the clean persons may eat of it
alike. 23 Only be sure that you do not con-
sume the blood, for the blood is the life;
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you will not eat the life with the meat. 24

You will not eat it; you will pour it out on
the earth like water. 25 You will not eat
it, so that it may go well with you, and
with your children after you, when you
will do what is right in the eyes of Yahweh.
26 But the things that belong to Yahweh
that you have and the offerings for your
vows—you will take these and go to the
place that Yahweh chooses. 27 There you
will offer your burnt offerings, the meat
and the blood, on the altar of Yahweh your
God; the blood of your sacrifices will be
poured out on the altar of Yahweh your
God, and you will eat the flesh. 28 Ob-
serve and listen to all these words that I
command you, that it may go well with
you and with your children after you for-
ever, when you do what is good and right
in the eyes of Yahweh your God.
29 When Yahweh your God cuts off the na-
tions from before you, when you go in to
dispossess them, and you dispossess them,
and live in their land, 30 pay attention
to yourself that you are not trapped into
following them, after they are destroyed
from before you—trapped into investigat-
ing their gods, into asking, ‘How do these
nations worship their gods? I will do the
same.’ 31 You will not do that in respect
to Yahweh your God, for everything that
is an abomination to Yahweh, things that
he hates—they have done these with their
gods; they even burn their sons and their
daughters in fire for their gods.
32 Whatever I command you, observe it.
Do not add to it or take away from it.

Chapter 13
1 If there arises among you a prophet or a
dreamer of dreams, and if he gives you a
sign or a wonder, 2 and if the sign or the
wonder comes about, of which he spoke

to you and said, ‘Let us go after other
gods, that you have not known, and let
us worship them,’ 3 do not listen to the
words of that prophet, or to that dreamer
of dreams; for Yahweh your God is test-
ing you to know whether you love Yah-
weh yourGodwith all your heart andwith
all your soul. 4 You will walk after Yah-
weh your God, honor him, keep his com-
mandments, and obey his voice, and you
will worship him and cling to him. 5 That
prophet or that dreamer of dreams will
be put to death, because he has spoken
rebellion against Yahweh your God, who
brought you out of the land of Egypt, and
who redeemed you out of the house of
bondage. That prophet wants to draw you
out of the way in which Yahweh your God
commanded you to walk. So put away the
evil from among you.

6 Suppose that your brother, the son of
your mother, or your son, or your daugh-
ter, or the wife of your bosom, or your
friend who is to you like your own soul,
secretly entices you and says, ’Let us go
and worship other gods that you have not
known, neither you nor your ancestors—
7 any of the gods of the peoples that are
round about you, near to you, or far off
from you, from the one end of the earth
to the other end of the earth.’ 8 Do not
consent to him or listen to him. Neither
must your eye pity him, neither will you
spare him or conceal him. 9 Instead, you
will surely kill him; your hand will be the
first on him to put him to death, and after-
wards the hand of all the people. 10 You
will stone him to death with stones, be-
cause he has tried to draw you away from
Yahweh your God, who brought you out
of the land of Egypt, out of the house of
bondage. 11 All Israel will hear and fear,
and will not continue to do this kind of
wickedness among you.

12 If you hear anyone say about one
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of your cities, that Yahweh your God
gives you to live in: 13 Some wicked
fellows have gone out from among you
and have drawn away the inhabitants
of their city and said, ‘Let us go and
worship other gods that you have not
known.’ 14 Then you will examine the
evidence, make search, and investigate it
thoroughly. When you discover that it is
true and certain that such an abominable
thing has been done among you, then you
will take action. 15 You will surely attack
the inhabitants of that city with the edge
of the sword, completely destroy it and all
the people who are in it, along with its
livestock, with the edge of the sword. 16

You will gather all the spoil from it into
the middle of its street and will burn the
city, as well as all its spoil—for Yahweh
your God. The city will be a heap of ruins
forever; it must never be built again. 17

None of those things set apart for destruc-
tionmust stick in your hand. Thismust be
the case, so that Yahwehwill turn from the
fierceness of his anger, show you mercy,
have compassion on you, and make you
increase in numbers, as he has sworn to
your fathers. 18 He will do this because
you are listening to the voice of Yahweh
your God, to keep all his commandments
that I am commanding you today, to do
that which is right in the eyes of Yahweh
your God.

Chapter 14
1 You are the people of Yahweh your God.
Do not cut yourselves, nor shave any part
of your face for the dead. 2 For you are
a nation that is set apart to Yahweh your
God, and Yahweh has chosen you to be a
people for his own possession, more than
all peoples that are on the surface of the
earth.
3 You must not eat any abominable thing.

4 These are the animals that you may eat:
the ox, the sheep, and the goat, 5 the deer,
the gazelle, the roebuck, the wild goat,
and ibex, and the antelope, and the moun-
tain sheep. 6 You may eat any animals
that parts the hoof, that is, that has the
hoof divided in two, and that chews the
cud. 7 Nevertheless, you must not eat
some animals that chew the cud or that
have the hoof divided in two: the camel,
the rabbit, and the rock badger; because
they chew the cud but do not part the hoof,
they are unclean for you. 8 The pig is un-
clean for you as well because he parts the
hoof but does not chew the cud; he is un-
clean to you. Do not eat pig meat, and do
not touch their carcasses.
9 Of these things that are inwater youmay
eat: whatever has fins and scales; 10 but
whatever has no fins and scales you must
not eat; they are unclean for you.
11 All clean birds youmay eat. 12 But these
are the birds that you must not eat: the
eagle, the vulture, the osprey, 13 the red
kite and black kite, any kind of falcon. 14

Youmust not eat any kind of raven, 15 and
the ostrich, and the night hawk, the sea
gull, any kind of hawk, 16 the little owl,
the great owl, the white owl, 17 the pel-
ican, the carrion vulture, the cormorant.
18 You must not eat the stork, any kind
of heron, the hoopoe, and the bat. 19 All
winged, swarming things are unclean for
you; they must not be eaten. 20 You may
eat all clean flying things.
21 Youmust not eat of anything that dies of
itself; youmay give it to the foreignerwho
is within your towns, that hemay eat it; or
you may sell it to a foreigner. For you are
a nation that is set apart to Yahweh your
God. You must not boil a young goat in its
mother’s milk.
22 You must surely tithe all the yield of
your seed, that which comes out from the
field year after year. 23 You must eat be-
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fore Yahweh your God, in the place that
he will choose as his sanctuary, the tithe
of your grain, of your new wine, and of
your oil, and the firstborn of your herd
and your flock; that you may learn to al-
ways honor Yahweh your God. 24 If the
journey is too long for you so that you are
not able to carry it, because the place that
Yahweh your God will choose as his sanc-
tuary is too far from you, then, when Yah-
weh God blesses you, 25 you will convert
the offering into money, tie up the money
in your hand, and go to the place that
Yahweh your God will choose. 26 There
you will spend the money for whatever
you desire: for oxen, or for sheep, or for
wine, or for strong drink, or for whatever
you desire; you will eat there before Yah-
weh your God, and you will rejoice, you
and your household. 27 The Levite who
is within your gates—do not forsake him,
for he has no portion nor inheritancewith
you.
28 At the end of every three years you will
present all the tithe of your produce in the
same year, and you will store it up within
your gates; 29 and the Levite, because he
has no portion nor inheritance with you,
and the foreigner, and the fatherless, and
thewidowwho arewithin your gates, will
come and eat and be satisfied. Do this so
that Yahweh your Godmay bless you in all
the work of your hand that you do.

Chapter 15
1 At the end of every seven years, you
must cancel debts. 2 This is the manner of
the release: every creditorwill cancel that
which he has lent to his neighbor; he will
not demand it from his neighbor or his
brother because Yahweh’s cancellation of
debts has been proclaimed. 3 From a for-
eigner you may demand it; but whatever

of yours is with your brother your hand
must release. 4 However, there should
be no poor among you (for Yahweh will
surely bless you in the land that he gives
you as an inheritance to possess), 5 if only
you diligently listen to the voice of Yah-
weh your God, to keep all these command-
ments that I am commanding you today.
6 For Yahweh your God will bless you, as
he promised you; you will lend to many
nations, but you will not borrow; you will
rule over many nations, but they will not
rule over you.

7 If there is a poor man among you, one of
your brothers, within any of your gates in
your land that Yahweh your God is giving
you, you must not harden your heart nor
shut your hand from your poor brother;
8 but you must surely open your hand to
him and surely lend him sufficient for his
need. 9 Be careful not to have a wicked
thought in your heart, saying, ‘The sev-
enth year, the year of release, is near,’ so
that you will not be stingy in regard to
your poor brother and give him nothing;
he might cry out to Yahweh about you,
and it would be sin for you. 10 You must
surely give to him, and your heart must
not be sorry when you give to him, be-
cause in return for this Yahweh your God
will bless you in all your work and in all
that you put your hand to. 11 For the poor
will never cease to exist in the land; there-
fore I command you and say, ‘You must
surely open your hand to your brother,
to your needy, and to your poor in your
land.’

12 If your brother, a Hebrewman, or a He-
brew woman, is sold to you and serves
you for six years, then in the seventh year
you must let him go free from you. 13

When you let him go free from you, you
must not let him go empty-handed. 14 You
must liberally provide for him out of your
flock, out of your threshing floor, and out
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of your winepress. As Yahweh your God
has blessed you, you must give to him. 15

Youmust remember that youwere a slave
in the land of Egypt, and that Yahweh your
God redeemed you; therefore I am com-
manding you today to do this. 16 It will
happen that if he says to you, ‘I will not
go away from you,’ because he loves you
and your house, and because he is well off
with you, 17 then youmust take an awl and
thrust it through his ear to a door, and he
will be your servant forever. You must do
the same with your female servant. 18 It
must not seem difficult for you to let him
go free from you, because he has served
you for six years and given twice the value
of a hired person. Yahweh your God will
bless you in all that you do.
19 All the firstbornmales in your herd and
your flock you must set apart to Yahweh
your God. You will do no work with the
firstborn of your herd, nor shear the first-
born of your flock. 20 You must eat the
firstborn before Yahweh your God year
by year in the place that Yahweh will
choose, you and your household. 21 If it
has any blemish—for example, if it is lame
or blind, or has any blemish whatever—
you must not sacrifice it to Yahweh your
God. 22 You will eat it within your gates;
the unclean and the clean persons alike
must eat it, as you would eat a gazelle or
a deer. 23 Only you must not eat its blood;
youmust pour its blood out on the ground
like water.

Chapter 16
1 Observe themonth of Abib, and keep the
Passover to Yahweh your God, for in the
month of Abib Yahweh your God brought
you out of Egypt by night. 2 You will sac-
rifice the Passover to Yahweh your God
with some of the flock and the herd in

the place that Yahweh will choose as his
sanctuary. 3 You will eat no leavened
bread with it; seven days will you eat un-
leavened bread with it, the bread of af-
fliction; for you came out of the land of
Egypt in haste. Do this all the days of your
life so that you may call to mind the day
when you came out of the land of Egypt. 4
No yeast must be seen among you within
all your borders during seven days; nor
must any of the meat that you sacrifice
in the evening on the first day remain un-
til the morning. 5 You may not sacri-
fice the Passover within any of your city
gates that Yahweh your God is giving you.
6 Instead, sacrifice at the place that Yah-
weh your Godwill choose as his sanctuary.
There youwill perform the sacrifice of the
Passover in the evening at the going down
of the sun, at the time of year that you
came out of Egypt. 7 Youmust roast it and
eat it at the place that Yahweh your God
will choose; in the morning you will turn
and go to your tents. 8 For six days you
will eat unleavened bread; on the seventh
day there will be a solemn assembly for
Yahweh your God; on that day you must
do no work.

9 You will count seven weeks for your-
selves; from the time you begin to put the
sickle to the standing grain youmust start
counting seven weeks. 10 You must keep
the Festival of Weeks for Yahweh your
God with the contribution of a freewill
offering from your hand that you will
give, according as Yahweh your God has
blessed you. 11 You will rejoice before
Yahweh your God—you, your son, your
daughter, your male servant, your female
servant, the Levite who is within your city
gates, and the foreigner, the fatherless,
and the widowwho are among you, at the
place that Yahweh your God will choose
for his sanctuary. 12 You will call to mind
that you were a slave in Egypt; you must
observe and do these statutes.
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13 You must keep the Festival of Shelters
for seven days after you have gathered in
the harvest from your threshing floor and
from your winepress. 14 You will rejoice
during your festival—you, your son, your
daughter, your male servant, your female
servant, the Levite, and the foreigner, and
the fatherless and the widow who are
within your gates. 15 For seven days you
must observe the festival for Yahweh your
God at the place that Yahweh will choose,
because Yahweh your God will bless you
in all yourharvest and all thework of your
hands, and you must be completely joy-
ful. 16 Three times in a year all yourmales
must appear before Yahweh your God at
the place that he will choose: at the Fes-
tival of Unleavened Bread, at the Festival
of Weeks, and at the Festival of Shelters;
and they will not appear before Yahweh
empty-handed; 17 instead, every man will
give as he is able, that youmight know the
blessing that Yahweh your God has given
to you.

18 You must make judges and officers
within all your city gates that Yahweh
your God is giving you; they will be taken
from each of your tribes, and they must
judge the people with righteous judgment.
19 Youmust not take justice away by force;
you must not show partiality nor take a
bribe, for a bribe blinds the eyes of the
wise and perverts the words of the righ-
teous. 20 You must follow after justice, af-
ter justice alone, so that you may live and
inherit the land that Yahweh your God is
giving you.

21 You must not set up for yourselves an
Asherah, any sort of pole, beside the altar
of Yahweh your God that you will make
for yourself. 22 Neither must you set up
for yourself any sacred stone pillar, which
Yahweh your God hates.

Chapter 17
1 You must not sacrifice to Yahweh your
God an ox or a sheep inwhich is any blem-
ish or anything bad, for that would be an
abomination to Yahweh your God.
2 If there is found among you, within
any of your city gates that Yahweh your
God is giving you, any man or woman
who does what is evil in the sight of
Yahweh your God and transgresses his
covenant, 3 anyonewhohas gone andwor-
shiped other gods and bowed down to
them, either the sun, the moon, or any of
the host of heaven—nothing that I have
commanded— 4 and if you are told about
this, or if you have heard of it, then you
must make a careful investigation. If it is
true and certain that such an abomination
has been done in Israel, this is what you
should do. 5 You must bring that man or
woman, who has done this evil thing, to
your city gates, that very man or woman,
and you must stone that person to death.
6 At the mouth of two witnesses, or three
witnesses, will he who must die be put to
death; but at the mouth of only one wit-
ness he must not be put to death. 7 The
hand of the witnesses must be the first to
put him to death, and afterward the hand
of all the people; and you will remove the
evil from among you.
8 If a matter arises that is too hard for
you to judge—perhaps a question of mur-
der or accidental death, of one person’s
right and another person’s right, or a ques-
tion of one kind of harm done, or another
kind of matter, matters of controversy
within your city gates—then you must go
up to the place that Yahweh your God will
choose as his sanctuary. 9 You must go to
the priests, the descendants of Levi, and
to the judge who will be serving at that
time; you will seek their advice, and they
will give you the verdict. 10 You must
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follow the law given to you at the place
Yahweh will choose as his sanctuary. You
will be careful to do everything that they
direct you to do. 11 Follow the law they
teach you, and do according to the deci-
sions they give you. Do not turn aside
from what they tell you, to the right hand
or to the left. 12 Anyone who acts arro-
gantly, in not listening to the priest who
is standing to serve before Yahweh your
God, or in not listening to the judge—that
man will die; you will put away the evil
from Israel. 13 All the people must hear
and fear, and act arrogantly no more.

14 When you have come to the land that
Yahweh your God gives you, and when
you take possession of it and begin to live
in it, and then you say, ‘I will set a king
over myself, like all the nations that are
round about me,’ 15 then you must surely
set as king over yourself someone whom
Yahweh your God will choose. You must
set as king over yourself someone from
among your brothers. You may not put a
foreigner, who is not your brother, over
yourself. 16 But he must not multiply
horses for himself, nor cause the people
to return to Egypt so that he may multi-
ply horses, for Yahweh had said to you,
‘You will never return that way again.’ 17

He must not take many wives for himself,
so that his heart does not turn away. He
must not accumulate large amounts of sil-
ver and gold.

18 When he sits on the throne of his king-
dom, he must write for himself in a scroll
a copy of this law, from the law that is be-
fore the priests, who are Levites. 19 The
scroll must be with him, and hemust read
in it all the days of his life, so that he may
learn to honor Yahweh his God, so as to
keep all the words of this law and these
statutes, to observe them. 20 He must
do this so that his heart is not lifted up
above his brothers, and so that he does

not turn away from the commandments,
to the right hand or to the left; for the pur-
pose that he may prolong his days in his
kingdom, he and his children, among Is-
rael.

Chapter 18
1 The priests, who are Levites, and all
the tribe of Levi, will have no portion
nor inheritance with Israel; they must eat
the offerings of Yahweh made by fire as
their inheritance. 2 They must have no in-
heritance among their brothers; Yahweh
is their inheritance, as he said to them.
3 This will be the priests’ due from the
people, from those who offer a sacrifice,
whether it be oxen or sheep: they must
give to the priest the shoulder, the two
cheeks, and the inner parts. 4 The first-
fruits of your grain, of your newwine, and
of your oil, and the first of the fleece of
your sheep, you must give him. 5 For Yah-
weh your God has chosen him out of all
your tribes to stand to serve in the name
of Yahweh, him and his sons forever.
6 If a Levite comes from any of your towns
out of all Israel from where he is living,
and desires with all his soul to come to the
place Yahweh will choose, 7 then he must
serve in the name of Yahweh his God as
all his brothers the Levites do, who stand
there before Yahweh. 8 They must have
similar portions to eat, besides of what
comes of the sale of his family’s inheri-
tance.
9 When you have come into the land that
Yahweh your God is giving you, you must
not learn to observe the abominations of
those nations. 10 There must not be found
among you any one who puts his son or
his daughter into the fire, anyone who
uses divination, anyone who practices au-
gury, or any enchanter, or any sorcerer,
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11 any charmer, anyone who talks with
the dead, or anyone who talks with spir-
its. 12 For whoever does these things is
an abomination to Yahweh; it is because
of these abominations that Yahweh your
God is driving them out from before you.
13 You must be blameless before Yahweh
your God. 14 For these nations that you
will dispossess listen to those who prac-
tice sorcery and divination; but as for you,
Yahweh your God has not allowed you to
do so.

15 Yahweh your God will raise up for you
a prophet from among you, one of your
brothers, like me. You must listen to him.
16 This is what you asked from Yahweh
your God at Horeb on the day of the as-
sembly, saying, ‘Let us not hear again the
voice of Yahweh our God, nor see this
great fire anymore, or wewill die.’ 17 Yah-
weh said to me, ’What they have said is
good. 18 I will raise up a prophet for them
from among their brothers, just like you.
I will put my words in his mouth, and he
will speak to them all that I command him.
19 It will happen that if anyone does not lis-
ten to the words of mine that he speaks in
my name, I will require it of him.

20 But the prophet who speaks a word ar-
rogantly in my name, a word that I have
not commanded him to speak, or who
speaks in the name of other gods, that
very prophetmust die.’ 21 This is what you
must say in your heart: ‘How will we rec-
ognize amessage that Yahwehhas not spo-
ken?’ 22 You will recognize a message
that Yahweh has spoken when a prophet
speaks in the name of Yahweh. If that
thing does not occur nor happen, then
that is something that Yahweh has not spo-
ken and the prophet has spoken it arro-
gantly, and youmust not be afraid of him.

Chapter 19
1 When Yahweh your God cuts off the na-
tions, those whose land Yahweh your God
is giving you, and when you come after
them and live in their cities and houses,
2 you must select three cities for yourself
in the middle of your land that Yahweh
your God is giving you to possess. 3 You
must build a road and divide the borders
of your land into three parts, the land that
Yahweh yourGod is causing you to inherit,
so that everyonewho kills another person
may flee there.

4 This is the law for the one who kills an-
other andwhoflees there to live: whoever
kills his neighbor unawares, and did not
previously hate him— 5 as when a man
goes into the forest with his neighbor to
cut wood, and his hand strikes with the
ax to cut down a tree, and the head slips
from the shaft and strikes his neighbor
so that he dies—then that man must flee
to one of these cities and live. 6 Other-
wise the avenger of blood might go after
the one who took a life, and in the heat
of his anger overtake him, if the distance
is too great, strike him and kill him, even
though that man did not deserve to die,
since he had not hated his neighbor in the
past. 7 Therefore I command you to se-
lect three cities for yourself. 8 If Yahweh
your God enlarges your borders, as he has
sworn to your ancestors to do, and gives
you all the land that he promised to give to
your ancestors; 9 if you keep all these com-
mandments to do them, which I am com-
manding you today—commandments to
love Yahweh your God and to alwayswalk
in hisways, then youmust add threemore
cities for yourself, besides these three. 10

Do this so that innocent blood is not shed
in the midst of the land that Yahweh your
God is giving you for as an inheritance, so
that no bloodguilt may be on you.
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11 But if anyone hates his neighbor, lies
in wait for him, rises up against him, and
mortally wounds him so that he dies, and
if he then flees into one of these cities— 12

then the elders of his city must send and
bring him back from there, and turn him
over into the hand of the responsible rela-
tive, so that he may die. 13 Your eye must
not pity him; instead, you must eradicate
the bloodguilt from Israel, that it may go
well with you.
14 You must not remove your neighbor’s
landmark that they set in place a long time
ago, in your inheritance that you will in-
herit, in the land that Yahweh your God is
giving you to possess.
15 One sole witness must not rise up
against a man for any iniquity, or for any
sin, in any matter that he sins; at the
mouth of two witnesses, or at the mouth
of three witnesses, must any matter be
confirmed. 16 Suppose that an unrigh-
teous witness rises up against any man
to testify against him of wrongdoing. 17

Then both men, the ones between whom
the controversy exists, must stand before
Yahweh, before the priests and the judges
who serve in those days. 18 The judges
must make diligent inquiries; see, if the
witness is a false witness and has testified
falsely against his brother, 19 then must
you do to him, as he had wished to do to
his brother; and you will remove the evil
from among you. 20 Then those who re-
main will hear and fear, and will from
then on commit no longer any such evil
among you. 21 Your eyes must not pity;
life will pay for life, eye for eye, tooth for
tooth, hand for hand, foot for foot.

Chapter 20
1 When you march out to battle against
your enemies, and see horses, chariots,

and a people more numerous than you,
you must not be afraid of them; for Yah-
weh your God iswith you, hewho brought
you up out of the land of Egypt. 2

When you are about to enter into battle,
the priest must approach and speak to the
people. 3 He must say to them, ’Listen, Is-
rael, you are going to battle against your
enemies. Do not let your hearts faint. Do
not fear or tremble. Do not be afraid of
them. 4 For Yahweh your God is the one
who is going with you to fight for you
against your enemies and to save you.’ 5

The officers must speak to the people and
say, ’What man is there who has built a
new house and has not dedicated it? Let
him go and return to his house, so that
he does not die in battle and another man
dedicates it. 6 Is there anyone who has
planted a vineyard and has not enjoyed
its fruit? Let him go home, so he will not
die in battle and another man enjoy its
fruit. 7 What man is there who is engaged
to marry a woman but has not yet mar-
ried her? Let him go home so that he does
not die in battle and another man mar-
ries her.’ 8 The officers must speak fur-
ther to the people and say, ‘What man is
there who is fearful or fainthearted? Let
him go and return to his house, so that his
brother’s heart does not melt like his own
heart.’ 9 When the officers have finished
speaking to the people, they must appoint
commanders over them.

10 When you march up to attack a city,
make those people an offer of peace. 11

If they accept your offer and open their
gates to you, all the people who are found
in itmust become forced labor for you and
must serve you. 12 But if it makes no
offer of peace to you, but instead makes
war against you, then you must besiege
it, 13 and when Yahweh your God gives
you victory andputs themunder your con-
trol, you must kill every man in the town.
14 But the women, the little ones, the cat-
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tle, and everything that is in the city, and
all its spoil, you will take as booty for
yourself. You will consume the booty of
your enemies, whom Yahweh your God
has given to you. 15 You must act in this
way toward all the cities that are very far
from you, cities that are not of the cities of
these following nations. 16 In the cities of
these peoples that Yahweh your God is giv-
ing you as an inheritance, you must save
alive nothing that breathes. 17 Instead,
you must completely destroy them: the
Hittite, and the Amorite, the Canaanite,
the Perizzite, the Hivite, and the Jebusite,
as Yahweh your God has commanded you.
18 Do this so that they do not teach you
to act in any of their abominable ways, as
they have done with their gods. If you do,
you will sin against Yahweh your God.
19 When you will besiege a city for a long
time, as you wage war against it to cap-
ture it, you must not destroy its trees by
wielding an ax against them. For you
may eat from them, so you must not cut
them down. For is the tree of the field a
man whom you should besiege? 20 Only
the trees that you know are not trees for
food, you may destroy and cut down; you
will build siege works against the city that
makes war with you, until it falls.

Chapter 21
1 If someone is found killed in the land
that Yahweh your God is giving you to
possess, lying in the field, and it is not
known who has attacked him; 2 then your
elders and your judges must go out, and
they must measure to the cities that are
around him who has been killed. 3 Then
the elders of the town nearest to the dead
man’s body must take a heifer from the
herd, one that has never been put to work,
and that has not borne the yoke. 4 Then

they must lead the heifer down to a val-
ley with running water, a valley that has
been neither plowed nor sown, and there
in the valley they must break the heifer’s
neck. 5 The priests, descendants of Levi,
must come near; for them Yahweh your
God has chosen to serve him and to bless
the people in the name of Yahweh; listen
to their advice, for their word will be the
verdict in every dispute and case of as-
sault. 6 All the elders of the city that is
the nearest to the killed man must wash
their hands over the heifer whose neck
was broken in the valley; 7 and they must
answer to the case and say, ’Our hands
have not shed this blood, neither have our
eyes seen it. 8 Forgive, Yahweh, your peo-
ple Israel, whom you have redeemed, and
do not put guilt for innocent bloodshed
in the midst of your people Israel.’ Then
the bloodshed will be forgiven them. 9 In
this way you will put away the innocent
blood from yourmidst, when you dowhat
is right in the eyes of Yahweh.

10 When you go out to do battle against
your enemies and Yahweh your God gives
you victory andputs themunder your con-
trol, and you take them away as captives,
11 if you see among the captives a beau-
tiful woman, and you have a desire for
her and wish to take her for yourself as
a wife, 12 then you will bring her home to
your house; she will shave her head and
cut her nails. 13 Then she will take off
the clothes shewaswearingwhen shewas
taken captive and she will remain in your
house and mourn for her father and her
mother a full month. After that you may
sleep with her and be her husband, and
she will be your wife. 14 But if you take
no delight in her, then you may let her go
where she wishes. But you must not sell
her at all for money, and you must not
treat her like a slave, because you have hu-
miliated her.
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15 If a man has two wives and one is
loved and the other is hated, and they
have both borne him children—both the
beloved wife and the hated wife—if the
firstborn son is of her that is hated, 16 then
on the day that the man causes his sons
to inherit what he possesses, he may not
make the son of the beloved wife the first-
born before the son of the hated wife, the
son who is actually the firstborn. 17 In-
stead, he must acknowledge the firstborn,
the son of the hated wife, by giving him a
double portion of all that he possesses; for
that son is the beginning of his strength;
the right of the firstborn belongs to him.
18 If a man has a stubborn and rebellious
son who will not obey the voice of his fa-
ther or the voice of his mother, and who,
even though they correct him, will not lis-
ten to them; 19 then his father and his
mother must lay hold on him and bring
him out to the elders of his city and to the
gate of his city. 20 They must say to the
elders of his city, ‘This son of ours is stub-
born and rebellious; he will not obey our
voice; he is a glutton and a drunkard.’ 21

Thenall themenof his citymust stonehim
to death with stones; and you will remove
the evil from among you. All Israel will
hear of it and fear.
22 If a man has committed a sin worthy of
death and he is put to death, and you hang
him on a tree, 23 then his body must not
remain all night on the tree. Instead, you
must surely bury him the same day; for
whoever is hanged is cursed by God. Obey
this commandment so that you do not de-
file the land that Yahweh your God is giv-
ing you as an inheritance.

Chapter 22
1 You must not watch your fellow Is-
raelite’s ox or his sheep go astray and

hide yourself from them; you must surely
bring them back to him. 2 If your fellow
Israelite is not near to you, or if you do
not know him, then you must bring the
animal home to your house, and it must
be with you until he looks for it, and then
you must restore it to him. 3 You must
do the same with his donkey; you must
do the same with his garment; you must
do the same with every lost thing of your
fellow Israelite’s, anything that he has lost
and you have found; you must not hide
yourself. 4 You must not see your fellow
Israelite’s donkey or his ox fallen down in
the road andhide yourself from them; you
must surely help him to lift it up again.
5 A woman must not wear what pertains
to a man, and neither must a man put on
women’s clothing; for whoever does these
things is an abomination to Yahweh your
God.
6 If a bird’s nest happens to be in front
of you on the road, in any tree or on the
ground, with young ones or eggs in it, and
the mother sitting on the young or on the
eggs, you must not take the mother along
with the young. 7 You must surely let the
mother go, but the young you may take
for yourself. Obey this command so that
it may go well with you, and that you may
prolong your days.
8 When you build a new house, then you
must make a railing for your roof so that
you do not bring blood on your house if
anyone falls from there.
9 You must not plant your vineyard with
two kinds of seed, so that the whole har-
vest is not confiscated by the holy place,
the seed that you have sown and the yield
of the vineyard. 10 Youmust not plowwith
an ox and a donkey together. 11 You must
not wear fabricmade of wool and linen to-
gether.
12 You must make yourself fringes on the
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four corners of the cloak with which you
clothe yourself.
13 Suppose a man takes a wife, sleeps with
her, and then hates her, 14 and then ac-
cuses her of shameful things and puts a
bad reputation on her, and says, ‘I took
this woman, but when I came near to her,
I found no proof of virginity in her.’ 15

Then the father and mother of the girl
must take proof of her virginity to the el-
ders at the city gate. 16 The girl’s father
must say to the elders, ’I gavemydaughter
to this man as a wife, and he hates her. 17
See, he has accused her of shameful things
and said, “I did not find in your daugh-
ter the proof of virginity.” But here is the
proof of my daughter’s virginity.’ Then
they will spread the garment out before
the elders of the city. 18 The elders of
that city must take that man and punish
him; 19 and they must fine him one hun-
dred shekels of silver, and give them to
the father of the girl, because theman has
caused a bad reputation for a virgin of Is-
rael. She must be his wife; he may not
send her away during all his days. 20 But
if this thing is true, that the proof of vir-
ginity was not found in the girl, 21 then
they must bring out the girl to the door
of her father’s house, and the men of her
city must stone her to death with stones,
because she has committed a disgraceful
action in Israel, to act as a harlot in her fa-
ther’s house; and you will remove the evil
from among you.
22 If aman is found sleepingwith awoman
who is married to another man, then they
must both die, the man who was sleeping
with the woman and the woman herself;
and you will remove the evil from among
you.
23 If there is a girl who is a virgin, engaged
to a man, and another man finds her in
the city and sleeps with her, 24 take both
of them to the city gate, and stone them

to death. You must stone the girl, because
she did not cry out, even though she was
in the city. You must stone the man, be-
cause he violated his neighbor’s wife; and
youwill remove the evil fromamong you.
25 But if the man finds the engaged girl in
the field, and if he seizes her and sleeps
with her, then only the man who sleeps
with her must die. 26 But to the girl you
must do nothing; there is no sin worthy
of death in the girl. For this case is like
when aman attacks his neighbor and kills
him. 27 For he found her in the field; the
engaged girl cried out, but there was no
one to save her.
28 If a man finds a girl who is a virgin but
who is not engaged, and if he seizes her
and sleepswith her, and if they are discov-
ered, 29 then the man who slept with her
must give fifty shekels of silver to the girl’s
father, and she must become his wife, be-
cause he has humiliated her. He may not
send her away during all his days.
30 A man must not take his father’s wife
as his own; he must not take away his fa-
ther’s marriage rights.

Chapter 23
1 No man injured by crushing or cutting
off may enter the assembly of Yahweh.
2 No illegitimate child may belong to the
assembly of Yahweh; as far as to the tenth
generation of his descendants, none of
them may belong to the assembly of Yah-
weh.
3 An Ammonite or a Moabite may not be-
long to the assembly of Yahweh; as far as
to the tenth generation of his descendants,
none of them may belong to the assem-
bly of Yahweh. 4 This is because they did
not meet you with bread and with water
on the road when you had come out of
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Egypt, and because they hired against you
Balaam son of Beor from Pethor in Aram
Naharaim, to curse you. 5 But Yahweh
your God would not listen to Balaam; in-
stead, Yahweh your God turned the curse
into a blessing for you, because Yahweh
yourGod loved you. 6 Youmust never seek
their peace or prosperity, during all your
days.
7 Youmust not detest an Edomite, for he is
your brother; youmust not abhor anEgyp-
tian, because you were a foreigner in his
land. 8 The descendants of the third gen-
eration that are born to them may belong
to the assembly of Yahweh.
9 When youmarch out as an army against
your enemies, then you must keep your-
selves from every evil thing. 10 If there is
among you any man who is unclean be-
cause of what happened to him at night,
then he must go out of the army’s camp;
he must not come back into the camp. 11

When evening comes, he must bathe him-
self in water; when the sun goes down, he
will come back inside the camp. 12 You
must have a place also outside the camp
to which you will go; 13 and you will have
something among your tools to dig with;
when you squat down to relieve yourself,
you must dig with it and then put back
the earth and cover up what has come out
from you. 14 For Yahweh your God walks
in the midst of your camp to give you vic-
tory and to handover your enemies to you.
Therefore your campmust be holy, so that
he may not see any unclean thing among
you and turn away from you.
15 You must not give back to his master a
slave who has escaped from his master. 16
Let him live with you, in whatever town
he chooses. Do not oppress him.
17 There must be no cultic prostitute
among any of the daughters of Israel,
neither must there be a cultic prostitute
among the sons of Israel. 18 You must

not bring the wages of a prostitute or the
wages of a dog into the house of Yahweh
your God for any vow; for both these are
abominations to Yahweh your God.
19 You must not lend on interest to your
fellow Israelite—interest of money, inter-
est of food, or the interest of anything that
is lent on interest. 20 To a foreigner you
may lend on interest; but to your fellow
Israelite you must not lend on interest, so
that Yahweh your God may bless you in
all that you put your hand to, in the land
which you are going in to possess.
21 When you make a vow to Yahweh your
God, you must not be slow in fulfilling it,
for Yahweh your God will surely require
it of you; it would be sin for you not to
fulfill it. 22 But if you will refrain from
making a vow, it will be no sin for you. 23

That which has gone out from your lips
you must observe and do; according as
you have vowed to Yahweh your God, any-
thing that you have freely promised with
your mouth.
24 When you go into your neighbor’s vine-
yard, you may eat as many grapes as you
desire, but do not put any in your basket.
25 When you go into your neighbor’s ripe
grain, you may pluck the heads of grain
with your hand, but do not put a sickle to
your neighbor’s ripe grain.

Chapter 24
1 When a man takes a wife and marries
her, if she finds no favor in his eyes be-
cause he has found some unsuitable thing
in her, then hemust write her a certificate
of divorce, put it into her hand, and send
her out of his house. 2 When she has gone
out of his house, she may go and be an-
otherman’s wife. 3 If the second husband
hates her andwrites her a certificate of di-
vorce, puts it into her hand, and sends her
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out of his house; or if the second husband
dies, themanwho took her to be hiswife—
4 then her former husband, the one who
had first sent her away, may not take her
again to be his wife, after she has become
impure; for thatwould be an abomination
to Yahweh. Youmust not cause the land to
become guilty, the land that Yahweh your
God is giving you as an inheritance.
5 When a man takes a new wife, he will
not go to war with the army, neither may
he be commanded to go on any forced
duty; he will be free to be at home for one
year and will cheer his wife whom he has
taken.
6 Nomanmay take amill or an uppermill-
stone as a pledge, for that would be taking
a person’s life as a pledge.
7 If a man is found kidnapping any of his
brothers from among the people of Israel,
and treats him as a slave and sells him,
that thief must die; and you will remove
the evil from among you.
8 Take heed regarding any plague of lep-
rosy, so that you carefully observe and fol-
low every instruction given to you which
the priests, the Levites, teach you; as I
commanded them, so you will act. 9 Call
to mind what Yahweh your God did to
Miriam as you were coming out of Egypt.
10 When you make your neighbor any
kind of loan, you must not go into his
house to fetch his pledge. 11 Youwill stand
outside, and the man to whom you have
lent will bring the pledge outside to you.
12 If he is a poor man, you must not sleep
with his pledge in your possession. 13 You
must surely restore to him the pledge by
the time the sun goes down, so that hemay
sleep in his cloak and bless you; it will
be righteousness for you before Yahweh
your God.
14 You must not oppress a hired servant
who is poor and needy, whether he is of

your fellow Israelites, or of the foreign-
ers who are in your land within your city
gates; 15 Each day you must give him his
wage; the sun must not go down on this
unsettled matter, for he is poor and is
counting on it. Do this so that he does not
cry out against you to Yahweh, and so that
it not be a sin that you have committed.
16 The parentsmust not be put to death for
their children, neither must the children
be put to death for their parents. Instead,
everyonemust be put to death for his own
sin.
17 You must not use force to take away the
justice that is due the foreigner or the fa-
therless, nor take the widow’s cloak as a
pledge. 18 Instead, you must call to mind
that you were a slave in Egypt, and that
Yahweh your God rescued you from there.
Therefore I instruct you to obey this com-
mand.
19 When you reap your harvest in your
field, and if you have forgotten a sheaf
in the field, you must not go back to get
it; it must be for the foreigner, for the fa-
therless, or for the widow, so that Yahweh
your God may bless you in all the work of
your hands. 20 When you shake your olive
tree, you must not go over the branches
again; it will be for the foreigner, for the
fatherless, or for the widow. 21 When
you gather the grapes of your vineyard,
you must not glean it again. What is left
over will be for the foreigner, for the fa-
therless, and for the widow. 22 You must
call to mind that you were a slave in the
land of Egypt; therefore I instruct you to
obey this command.

Chapter 25
1 If there is a dispute between men and
they go to court, and the judges judge
them, then they will acquit the righteous
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and condemn the wicked. 2 If the guilty
man deserves to be beaten, then the judge
will make him lie down and be beaten in
his presence with the ordered number of
blows, as was his crime. 3 The judge
may give him forty blows, but he may
not exceed that number; for if he should
exceed that number and beat him with
many more blows, then your fellow Is-
raelite would be humiliated before your
eyes.
4 You must not muzzle the ox when he
treads out the grain.
5 If brothers live together and one of them
dies, not having any son, then the wife
of the dead man must not be married off
to someone else outside the family. In-
stead, her husband’s brother must sleep
with her and take her to himself as a wife,
and do the duty of a husband’s brother
to her. 6 This is so that the firstborn that
she bears will succeed in the name of that
man’s dead brother, so that his name will
not perish from Israel. 7 But if the man
does notwish to take his brother’s wife for
himself, then his brother’s wife must go
up to the gate to the elders and say, ‘My
husband’s brother refuses to raise up for
his brother a name in Israel; he will not
perform the duty of a husband’s brother
to me.’ 8 Then the elders of his city must
call him and speak to him. But suppose
that he insists and says, ‘I do not wish to
take her.’ 9 Then his brother’s wife must
come up to him in the presence of the el-
ders, take off his sandal from his foot, and
spit in his face. She must answer him
and say, ‘This is what is done to the man
whodoes not build uphis brother’s house.’
10 His name will be called in Israel, ‘The
house of himwhose sandal has been taken
off.’
11 If men fight with each other, and the
wife of one comes to rescue her husband
out of the hand of him who struck him,

and if she stretches out her hand and
takes him by the private parts, 12 then you
must cut off her hand; your eyemust have
no pity.
13 You must not have in your bag differ-
ent weights, a large and a small. 14 You
must not have in your house different
measures, a large and a small. 15 A per-
fect and just weight you must have; a per-
fect and just measure you must have, so
that your days may be long in the land
that Yahweh your God is giving you. 16

For all who do such things, all that act un-
righteously, are an abomination to Yah-
weh your God.
17 Call to mind what Amalek did to you
on the road as you came out of Egypt, 18
how he met you on the road and attacked
those of you at the rear, all who were fee-
ble in your rear, when you were faint and
weary; he did not honor God. 19 Therefore,
when Yahweh yourGodhas given you rest
from all your enemies round about, in the
land that Yahweh your God is giving you
to possess as an inheritance, youmust not
forget that you must blot out the remem-
brance of Amalek from under heaven.

Chapter 26
1 When you have come into the land that
Yahweh your God is giving you as an in-
heritance, and when you possess it and
live in it, 2 then you must take some of
the first of all the harvest of the land that
you have brought in from the land that
Yahweh your God is giving you. You must
put it in a basket and go to the place that
Yahweh your God will choose as his sanc-
tuary. 3 You must go to the priest who
will be serving in those days and say to
him, ‘I acknowledge today to Yahweh your
God that I have come to the land that Yah-
weh swore to our ancestors to give us.’ 4
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The priestmust take the basket out of your
hand and set it down before the altar of
Yahweh your God. 5 You must say be-
fore Yahweh yourGod, ’My ancestorwas a
wandering Aramean. He went down into
Egypt and stayed there, and his people
were few in number. There he became a
great, mighty, and populous nation. 6 The
Egyptians treated us badly and afflicted
us. They made us do the work of slaves.
7 We cried out to Yahweh, the God of our
fathers, and he heard our voice and saw
our affliction, our labor, and our oppres-
sion. 8 Yahweh brought us out of Egypt
with a mighty hand, with an outstretched
arm, with great fearsomeness, with signs,
and with wonders; 9 and he has brought
us to this place and has given us this land,
a land that flows with milk and honey.
10 Now look, I have brought the first of
the harvest of the land that you, Yahweh,
have given me.’ You must set it down be-
fore Yahweh your God and worship be-
fore him; 11 and youmust rejoice in all the
good that Yahweh your God has done for
you, for your house—you, and the Levite,
and the foreigner who is among you.

12 When you have finished giving all the
tithe of your harvest in the third year,
that is, the year of tithing, then you must
give it to the Levite, to the foreigner, to
the fatherless, and to the widow, so that
theymay eat within your city gates and be
filled. 13 Youmust say before Yahweh your
God, ’I have brought out of my house the
things that belong to Yahweh, and have
given them to the Levite, to the foreigner,
to the fatherless, and to the widow, ac-
cording to all your commandments that
you have given me. I have not trans-
gressed any of your commandments, nei-
ther have I forgotten them. 14 I have not
eaten any of it in my mourning, nor have
I put it somewhere else when I was im-
pure, nor have I given any of it in honor
of the dead. I have listened to the voice

of Yahweh my God; I have obeyed every-
thing you have commanded me to do. 15

Look down from the holy placewhere you
live, from heaven, and bless your people
Israel, and the land that you have given
us, as you had sworn to our fathers, a land
flowing with milk and honey.’
16 Today Yahweh your God is command-
ing you to obey these statutes and decrees;
youwill therefore keep them and do them
with all your heart and with all your soul.
17 You have declared today that Yahweh
is your God, and that you will walk in his
ways and keep his statutes, his command-
ments, and his decrees, and that you will
listen to his voice. 18 Today Yahweh has
declared that you are a people who are
his own possession, as he had promised
to make you, and that you should keep
all his commandments. 19 Yahweh has
today declared that he will set you high
above all the other nations that he has
made, in respect to praise, to reputation,
and to honor. You will be a people that is
set apart to Yahweh your God, just as he
said.”

Chapter 27
1 Moses and the elders of Israel com-
manded the people and said, ”Keep all the
commandments that I command you to-
day. 2 On the day when you will pass over
the Jordan to the land that Yahweh your
God is giving you, you must set up some
large stones and plaster themwith plaster.
3 You must write on them all the words
of this law when you have passed over;
that you may go into the land that Yah-
weh your God is giving you, a land flow-
ing with milk and honey, as Yahweh, the
God of your ancestors, has promised you.
4 When you have passed over the Jordan,
set up these stones that I am command-
ing you about today, on Mount Ebal, and
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plaster them with plaster. 5 There you
must build an altar to Yahweh your God,
an altar of stones; but you must raise no
iron tool to work the stones. 6 You must
build the altar of Yahweh your God of un-
worked stones; youmust offer burnt offer-
ings on it to Yahweh your God, 7 and you
will sacrifice fellowship offerings and will
eat there; you will rejoice before Yahweh
your God. 8 You will write on the stones
all the words of this law very plainly.”
9 Moses and the priests, the Levites, spoke
to all Israel and said, ”Be silent and listen,
Israel: Today you have become the people
of Yahweh your God. 10 You must there-
fore obey the voice of Yahweh your God
and obey his commandments and statutes
that I am commanding you today.”
11 Moses commanded the people the same
day and said, 12 ”These tribes must stand
onMount Gerizim to bless the people after
you have passed over the Jordan: Simeon,
Levi, Judah, Issachar, Joseph, and Ben-
jamin. 13 These are the tribes that must
stand onMount Ebal to pronounce curses:
Reuben, Gad, Asher, Zebulun, Dan, and
Naphtali. 14 The Levites will answer and
say to all themen of Israel in a loud voice:
15 ‘May the man be cursed who makes a
carved or cast figure, an abomination to
Yahweh, the work of the hands of a crafts-
man, andwho sets it up in secret.’ Then all
the people must answer and say, ‘Amen.’
16 ‘May the man be cursed who dishonors
his father or his mother.’ Then all the peo-
ple must say, ‘Amen.’
17 ‘May the man be cursed who removes
his neighbor’s landmark.’ Then all the
people must say, ‘Amen.’
18 ‘May the man be cursed who makes
the blind to wander away from the road.’
Then all the people must say, ‘Amen.’
19 ‘May the man be cursed who uses force
to take away the justice due to a foreigner,

fatherless, or widow.’ Then all the people
must say, ‘Amen.’
20 ‘May the man be cursed who lies with
his father’s wife, because he has taken
away his father’s rights.’ Then all the peo-
ple must say, ‘Amen.’
21 ‘May themanbe cursedwho sleepswith
any kind of beast.’ Then all the people
must say, ‘Amen.’
22 ‘May themanbe cursedwho sleepswith
his sister, the daughter of his father, or
with the daughter of his mother.’ Then all
the people must say, ‘Amen.’
23 ‘May themanbe cursedwho sleepswith
his mother-in-law.’ Then all the people
must say, ‘Amen.’
24 ‘May the man be cursed who kills his
neighbor secretly.’ Then all the people
must say, ‘Amen.’
25 ‘May the man be cursed who takes a
bribe to kill an innocent person.’ Then all
the people must say, ‘Amen.’
26 ‘May the man be cursed who does not
confirm the words of this law, that he will
obey them.’ Then all the people must say,
‘Amen.’

Chapter 28
1 If you listen carefully to the voice of Yah-
weh your God so as to keep all his com-
mandments that I am commanding you to-
day, Yahweh your God will set you above
all the other nations of the earth. 2 All
these blessings will come on you and over-
take you, if you listen to the voice of Yah-
weh your God. 3 Blessedwill you be in the
city, and blessed will you be in the field.
4 Blessed will be the fruit of your body,
and the fruit of your ground, and the fruit
of your beasts, the increase of your cattle,
and the young of yourflock. 5 Blessedwill
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be your basket and your kneading trough.
6 Blessed will you be when you come in,
and blessed will you be when you go out.

7 Yahweh will cause your enemies who
rise up against you to be struck down be-
fore you; they will come out against you
one way but will flee before you seven
ways. 8 Yahweh will command the bless-
ing to come on you in your barns and in
all that you put your hand to; he will bless
you in the land that he is giving you. 9

Yahwehwill establish you as a people that
is set apart for himself, as he has sworn
to you, if you keep the commandments of
Yahweh your God, and walk in his ways.
10 All the peoples of the earth will see that
you are called by the name of Yahweh,
and they will be afraid of you. 11 Yahweh
will make you very prosperous in the fruit
of your body, in the fruit of your cattle, in
the fruit of your ground, in the land that
he swore to your fathers to give you. 12

Yahwehwill open to you his storehouse of
the heavens to give the rain for your land
at the right time, and to bless all the work
of your hand; you will lend to many na-
tions, but you will not borrow. 13 Yahweh
will make you the head, and not the tail;
youwill be only above, and youwill never
be beneath, if you listen to the command-
ments of Yahweh your God that I am com-
manding you today, so as to observe and
to do them, 14 and if you do not turn away
fromany of thewords that I am command-
ing you today, to the right hand or to the
left, so as to go after other gods to serve
them.

15 But if you do not listen to the voice
of Yahweh your God, so as to keep all
his commandments and his statutes that I
am commanding you today, then all these
curses will come on you and overtake
you. 16 Cursed will you be in the city, and
cursed will you be in the field. 17 Cursed
will be your basket and your kneading

trough. 18 Cursed will be the fruit of
your body, the fruit of your ground, the
increase of your cattle, and the young of
your flock. 19 Cursedwill you bewhen you
come in, and cursed will you be when you
go out.

20 Yahweh will send on you curses, con-
fusion, and rebukes in all that you put
your hand to, until you are destroyed, and
until you perish quickly because of your
wicked actions bywhich youwill have for-
sakenme. 21 Yahwehwill make the plague
cling to you until he destroys you from off
the land that you are going in to possess.
22 Yahweh will attack you with infectious
diseases, with fever, with inflammation,
and with drought and blistering heat, and
with scorching winds and mildew. These
will pursue you until you perish. 23

Your skies that are over your head will be
bronze, and the earth that is under you
will be iron. 24 Yahweh will make the rain
of your land into powder and dust; from
the heavens will it come down on you, un-
til you are destroyed.

25 Yahweh will cause you to be struck
down before your enemies; you will go
out one way against them but will flee be-
fore them seven ways. You will be tossed
to and fro among all the kingdoms of the
earth. 26 Your dead body will be food to
all the birds of the heavens and to the
beasts of the earth; there will be no one
to frighten them away. 27 Yahweh will at-
tack you with the boils of Egypt and with
ulcers, scurvy, and itch, from which you
cannot be healed. 28 Yahweh will attack
you with madness, with blindness, and
with mental confusion. 29 You will grope
about at noonday like the blind grope in
the darkness, and you will not prosper in
your ways; you will be always oppressed
and robbed, and there will be no one to
save you. 30 You will become engaged to
a woman, but another man will seize her
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and rape her. You will build a house but
not live in it; you will plant a vineyard but
not enjoy its fruit. 31 Your ox will be slain
before your eyes, but you will not eat its
meat; your donkey will be forcibly taken
away from before you and will not be re-
stored to you. Your sheep will be given to
your enemies, and you will have no one
to aid you. 32 Your sons and your daugh-
ters will be given to other peoples; your
eyes will look for them the entire day, but
will fail with longing for them. There will
be no strength in your hand. 33 The har-
vest of your land and of all your labors—
a nation that you do not know will eat
it up; you will always be oppressed and
crushed, 34 so that youwill become insane
by what you have to see happen. 35 Yah-
weh will attack you in the knees and legs
with severe boils from which you cannot
be cured, from the bottom of your feet to
the top of your head.

36 Yahweh will take you and the king
whom you will place over yourself to a
nation that you have not known, neither
you nor your ancestors; there you will
worship other gods of wood and stone.
37 You will become a source of horror, a
proverb, and a byword, among all the peo-
ples where Yahwehwill lead you away. 38

You will take much seed out into the field,
but will gather little seed in, for the lo-
custs will consume it. 39 You will plant
vineyards and cultivate them, but youwill
neither drink any of the wine, nor even
gather in the grapes, for worms will eat
them. 40 You will have olive trees within
all your territory, but you will not rub any
of the oil on yourself, for your olive trees
will drop their fruit. 41 You will have sons
and daughters, but they will not remain
yours, for theywill go into captivity. 42 All
your trees and the fruit of your ground—
the locusts will take them over. 43 The
foreigner who is among you will rise up
above you higher and higher; you your-

self will come down lower and lower. 44

He will lend to you, but you will not lend
to him; he will be the head, and you will
be the tail. 45 All these curses will come
on you and will pursue and overtake you
until you are destroyed. This will happen
because you did not listen to the voice of
Yahweh your God, so as to keep his com-
mandments and his regulations that he
commanded you. 46 These curses will be
on you as signs and wonders, and on your
descendants forever.

47 Because you did not worship Yahweh
your God with joyfulness and gladness
of heart when you were in prosperity, 48
therefore will you serve the enemies that
Yahweh will send against you; you will
serve them in hunger, in thirst, in naked-
ness, and in poverty. He will put a yoke
of iron on your neck until he destroys you.
49 Yahweh will bring a nation against you
from far away, from the ends of the earth,
like an eagle flies to its victim, a nation
whose language you do not understand;
50 a nation with a fierce face that does
not respect the aged and does not show
favor to the young. 51 They will eat the
young of your cattle and the fruit of your
land until you are destroyed. They will
leave for you no grain, new wine, or oil,
no young of your cattle or of your flock,
until they have caused you to perish. 52

Theywill besiege you in all your city gates,
until your high and fortified walls come
down everywhere in your land, walls in
which you had trusted. They will besiege
you within all your city gates throughout
all the land that Yahweh your God had
given you. 53 You will eat the fruit of your
own body, the flesh of your sons and of
your daughters, whom Yahweh your God
gave you, in the siege and in the distress
with which your enemies will put upon
you. 54 The man who is tender and very
delicate among you—he will be envious
of his brother and his own dear wife, and
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of whatever children he has left. 55 So he
will not give to any of them the flesh of
his own children that he is going to eat,
because he will have nothing left for him-
self in the siege and in the distress which
your enemy will put upon you within all
your city gates. 56 The tender and delicate
woman among you, who would not ven-
ture to put the bottom of her foot on the
ground for delicateness and tenderness—
she will be envious of her own dear hus-
band, of her son, and of her daughter, 57
and of her own newborn that comes out
frombetweenher legs, and of the children
whom she will bear. She will eat them in
private for lack of anything else, during
the siege and in the distress which your
enemy will put upon you within your city
gates.

58 If you do not keep all the words of this
law that are written in this book, so as to
honor this glorious and fearful name, Yah-
weh your God, 59 then Yahweh will make
your plagues terrible, and those of your
descendants; theywill be great plagues, of
long duration, and severe diseases, of long
duration. 60Hewill bring on you again all
the diseases of Egypt that you were afraid
of; theywill cling to you. 61 Also every sick-
ness and plague that is not written in the
book of this law, those also Yahweh will
bring on you until you are destroyed. 62

You will be left few in number, although
you were like the stars of the heavens in
number, because you did not listen to the
voice of Yahweh your God. 63 As Yahweh
once rejoiced over you in doing you good,
and in multiplying you, so he will rejoice
over you in making you perish and in de-
stroying you. You will be plucked off the
land that you are going into to possess. 64

Yahwehwill scatter you among all peoples
from the one end of the earth to the other
end of the earth; there you will worship
other gods that you have not known, nei-
ther you nor your ancestors, gods of wood

and stone. 65 Among these nations will
you find no ease, and there will be no rest
for the bottoms of your feet; instead, Yah-
weh will give you there a trembling heart,
failing eyes, and a soul that mourns. 66

Your life will hang in doubt before you;
you will fear every night and day and will
have no certainty at all in your life. 67 In
the morning you will say, ‘I wish it were
evening!’ and in the evening you will say,
‘I wish it were morning!’ because of the
fear in your hearts and the things your
eyes will have to see. 68 Yahwehwill bring
you into Egypt again by ships, by the route
about which I had said to you, ‘You will
not see Egypt again.’ There you will of-
fer yourselves for sale to your enemies as
male and female slaves, but no one will
purchase you.”

Chapter 29
1 These are the words that Yahweh com-
manded Moses to tell the people of Is-
rael in the land of Moab, words that were
added to the covenant that he had made
with them at Horeb.
2 Moses called to all Israel and said to
them, ”You have seen everything that Yah-
weh did before your eyes in the land of
Egypt to Pharaoh, to all his servants, and
to all his land— 3 the great sufferings that
your eyes saw, the signs, and those great
wonders. 4 But until today Yahwehhas not
given you a heart to know, eyes to see, or
ears to hear. 5 I have led you for forty
years in the wilderness; your clothes did
not wear out on you, and your sandals
did not wear out on your feet. 6 You did
not eat any bread, and you did not drink
anywine or other alcoholic drinks, so that
you might know that I am Yahweh your
God. 7 When you came to this place, Si-
hon, the king of Heshbon, andOg, the king
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of Bashan, came out against us to fight,
andwe struck them down. 8 We took their
land and gave it as an inheritance to the
Reubenites, to the Gadites, and to the half
tribe of Manasseh. 9 Therefore keep the
words of this covenant and do them, so
that you may prosper in everything that
you do.
10 You stand today, all of you, before Yah-
weh your God; your chiefs, your tribes,
your elders, and your officers—all the
men of Israel, 11 your little ones, your
wives, and the foreigner who is among
you in your camp, from him who cuts
your wood to him who draws your water.
12 You are here in order to enter into the
covenant of YahwehyourGodand into the
oath that YahwehyourGod ismakingwith
you today, 13 so that he may make you to-
day into a people for himself, and that he
may be God for you, as he spoke to you,
and as he swore to your ancestors, to Abra-
ham, to Isaac, and to Jacob.
14 For it is not only with you that I ammak-
ing this covenant and this oath— 15 with
everyone standing here with us today be-
fore Yahweh our God—but alsowith those
who are not here with us today.
16 You know how we lived in the land
of Egypt, and how we came through the
midst of the nations through which you
passed. 17 You have seen their disgust-
ing things: their idols of wood and stone,
silver and gold, that were among them.
18 Make sure there is not among you any
man, woman, family, or tribe whose heart
is turning away today from Yahweh our
God, so as to go worship the gods of those
nations. Make sure there is not among
you any root that produces gall andworm-
wood. 19 When that person hears the
words of this curse, he will bless himself
in his heart and say, ‘I will have peace,
though I walk in the stubbornness of my
heart.’ This would destroy the wet to-

gether with the dry. 20 Yahweh will not
pardon him, but instead, the anger of Yah-
weh and his jealousy will smolder against
that man, and all the curses that are writ-
ten in this book will come on him, and
Yahweh will blot out his name from un-
der heaven. 21 Yahweh will set him apart
for disaster out of all the tribes of Israel, in
keepingwith all the curses of the covenant
that are written in this book of the law.

22 The generation to come, your children
who will rise up after you, and the for-
eigner who comes from a distant land,
will speak when they see the plagues on
this land and the diseases with which Yah-
weh has made it sick— 23 and when they
see that the whole land has become sul-
fur and burning salt, where nothing is
sown or bears fruit, where no vegetation
grows, like the overthrow of Sodom and
Gomorrah, Admah and Zeboiim, that Yah-
weh destroyed in his anger andwrath— 24

theywill say togetherwith all the other na-
tions, ‘Why has Yahweh done this to this
land? What does the heat of this great
anger mean?’ 25 Then people will say, ’It
is because they abandoned the covenant
of Yahweh, the God of their ancestors,
that he made with them when he brought
them out of the land of Egypt, 26 and be-
cause they went and served other gods
and bowed down to them, gods that they
had not known and that he had not given
to them. 27 Therefore the anger of Yah-
weh has been kindled against this land, so
as to bring on it all the curses that arewrit-
ten in this book. 28 Yahweh has uprooted
them from their land in anger, in wrath,
and in great fury, and has thrown them
into another land, as today.’ 29 The secret
matters belong alone to Yahweh our God;
but the things that are revealed belong for-
ever to us and to our descendants, so that
we may do all the words of this law.
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Chapter 30
1 When all these things have come on you,
the blessings and the curses that I have
set before you, and when you call them to
mind among all the other nations where
Yahweh your God has driven you, 2 and
when you return to Yahweh your God and
obey his voice, following all that I am
commanding you today— you and your
children—with all your heart and with all
your soul, 3 then Yahweh your God will
reverse your captivity and have compas-
sion on you; hewill return and gather you
from all the peoples where Yahweh your
God has scattered you. 4 If any of your
exiled people are in the farthest places un-
der the heavens, from there Yahweh your
God will gather you, and from there he
will bring you. 5 Yahweh your God will
bring you into the land that your forefa-
thers possessed, and you will possess it
again; he will do you good and will mul-
tiply you more than he did your forefa-
thers. 6 Yahweh your God will circum-
cise your heart and the heart of your de-
scendants, so you will love Yahweh your
God with all your heart and with all your
soul, so that you may live. 7 Yahweh your
God will put all these curses on your en-
emies and on those who hate you, those
who persecuted you. 8 Youwill return and
obey the voice of Yahweh, and you will
do all his commandments that I am com-
manding you today. 9 Yahweh your God
will make you abundant in all the work
of your hand, in the fruit of your body, in
the fruit of your cattle, and in the fruit of
your ground, for prosperity; for Yahweh
will again rejoice over you for prosperity,
as he rejoiced over your fathers. 10 Hewill
do this if you will obey the voice of Yah-
weh your God, so as to keep his command-
ments and regulations that are written in
this book of the law, if you turn to Yahweh
your God with all your heart and all your

soul.

11 For this commandment that I am com-
manding you today is not too hard for you,
neither is it too far for you to reach. 12 It is
not in heaven, so that you should have to
say, ‘Who will go up for us to heaven and
bring it down to us and make us able to
hear it, so that wemay do it?’ 13 Neither is
it beyond the sea, so that you should have
to say, ‘Whowill go over the sea for us and
bring it to us andmakeus to hear it, so that
wemay do it?’ 14 But theword is very near
to you, in your mouth and your heart, so
that you may do it.

15 See, today I have placed before you life
and good, death and evil. 16 If you obey
the decrees of Yahweh your God, in which
I am commanding you today to love Yah-
weh your God, to walk in his ways, and to
keep his commandments, his regulations,
and his statutes, you will live and multi-
ply, and Yahweh your God will bless you
in the land that you are entering to pos-
sess. 17 But if your heart turns away, and
you do not listen but instead are drawn
away and bow down to other gods and
worship them, 18 then I announce to you
today that you will surely perish; you will
not prolong your days in the land that you
are passing over the Jordan to go into and
possess. 19 I call heaven and earth to wit-
ness against you today that I have set be-
fore you life and death, the blessings and
the curses; therefore choose life so that
you may live, you and your descendants.
20 Do this so as to love Yahweh your God,
to obey his voice, and to cling to him. For
he is your life and the length of your days;
do this so that youmay live in the land that
Yahweh swore to your ancestors, to Abra-
ham, to Isaac, and to Jacob, to give them.”
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Chapter 31
1 Moses went and spoke these words to all
Israel. 2 He said to them, ”I am now one
hundred twenty years old; I can no more
go out and come in; Yahweh has said to
me, ‘You will not go over this Jordan.’ 3

Yahweh your God, he will go over before
you; he will destroy these nations from
before you, and you will dispossess them.
Joshua, he will go over before you, as Yah-
wehhas spoken. 4 Yahwehwill do to them
as he did to Sihon and to Og, the kings
of the Amorites, and to their land, which
he destroyed. 5 Yahweh will give you vic-
tory over them when you meet them in
battle, and you will do to them all that I
commanded you. 6 Be strong and of good
courage, fear not, and do not be afraid of
them; for Yahweh your God, he it is who
goes with you; he will not fail you nor for-
sake you.” 7 Moses called to Joshua and
said to him in the sight of all Israel, ”Be
strong and of good courage, for you will
go with this people into the land that Yah-
weh has sworn to their ancestors to give
them; you will cause them to inherit it. 8

Yahweh, he it is who goes before you; he
will be with you; he will not fail you nor
abandon you; do not be afraid, do not be
discouraged.”

9 Moses wrote this law and gave it out to
the priests, the sons of Levi, who carried
the ark of the covenant of Yahweh; he also
gave copies of it to all the elders of Israel.
10 Moses commanded them and said, ”At
the end of every seven years, at the time
fixed for the cancellation of debts, during
the Festival of Shelters, 11 when all Israel
has come to appear before Yahweh your
God in the place that hewill choose for his
sanctuary, you will read this law before
all Israel in their hearing. 12 Assemble the
people, the men, the women, and the lit-
tle ones, and your foreigner who is within

your city gates, so that they may hear and
learn, and so that theymay honor Yahweh
your God and keep all the words of this
law. 13 Do this so that their children, who
have not known, may hear and learn to
honor Yahweh your God, as long as you
live in the land that you are going over the
Jordan to possess.”

14 Yahweh said to Moses, “Look, the day
is coming when you must die; call Joshua
and present yourselves in the tent ofmeet-
ing, so that I may give him a command.”
Moses and Joshua went and presented
themselves in the tent of meeting. 15 Yah-
weh appeared in the tent in a pillar of
cloud; the pillar of cloud stood over the
door of the tent. 16 Yahweh said to
Moses, ”Look, you will sleep with your fa-
thers; this people will rise up and act like
a prostitute going after the strange gods
that are among them in the land where
they are going. They will forsake me and
break my covenant that I have made with
them. 17 Then, on that day, my anger will
be kindled against them and I will aban-
don them. I will hide my face from them
and they will be devoured. Many disas-
ters and troubles will find them so that
theywill say on that day, ‘Have these disas-
ters not come upon us because our God is
not in our midst?’ 18 I will surely hide my
face from them on that day because of all
the evil that they will have done, because
they has turned to other gods. 19 Now
therefore write this song for yourselves
and teach it to the people of Israel. Put it
in their mouths, so that this song may be
a witness for me against the people of Is-
rael. 20 For when I will have brought them
into the land that I swore to give to their
ancestors, a land flowing with milk and
honey, and when they have eaten and be-
come satisfied and fat, then they will turn
to other gods and theywill serve themand
they will despise me and they will break
my covenant. 21 When many evils and
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troubles come upon this people, this song
will testify before them as a witness (for it
will not be forgotten from the mouths of
their descendants). For I know the plans
that they are forming today, even before
I have brought them into the land that I
promised them.” 22 So Moses wrote this
song the same day and taught it to the peo-
ple of Israel. 23 Yahweh gave Joshua son of
Nun a command and said, “Be strong and
of good courage; for youwill bring the peo-
ple of Israel into the land that I swore to
them, and I will be with you.”

24 It happened that when Moses had fin-
ished writing the words of this law in a
book, 25 that he commanded the Levites
who carried the ark of the covenant of
Yahweh, and he said, 26 ”Take this book of
the law and put it by the side of the ark
of the covenant of Yahweh your God, so
that it may be there as a witness against
you. 27 For I know your rebellion and
your stiff neck; look, while I am still alive
with you even today, you have been rebel-
lious against Yahweh; how much more af-
ter my death? 28 Assemble to me all the
elders of your tribes, and your officers,
so that I may speak these words in their
ears and call heaven and earth to witness
against them. 29 For I know that after my
death you will utterly corrupt yourselves
and turn aside out of the path that I have
commanded you; disaster will come on
you in the following days. This will hap-
pen because youwill do what is evil in the
sight of Yahweh, so as to provoke him to
anger through the work of your hands.”

30 Moses recited in the ears of all the as-
sembly of Israel the words of this song un-
til they were finished.

Chapter 32
1 Give ear, you heavens, and let me

speak.

Let the earth listen to the words of my
mouth.

2 Let my teaching drop down like the
rain,

let my speech distill like the dew,

like the gentle rain on the tender grass,

and like the showers on the plants.
3 For I will proclaim the name of Yah-

weh,

and ascribe greatness to our God.
4 The Rock, his work is perfect;

for all his paths are just.

He is the faithful God, without iniquity.

He is just and upright.
5 They have acted corruptly against him.

They are not his children. It is their
disgrace.

They are a perverted and crooked gen-
eration.

6 Do you reward Yahweh in this way,

you foolish and senseless people?

Is he not your father, the one who has
created you?

He made you and established you.

7 Call to mind the days of ancient times,

think about the years of many ages past.

Ask your father and he will show you,

your elders and they will tell you.
8 When the Most High gave the nations

their inheritance—

when he divided all of mankind,
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and he set the boundaries of the peo-
ples,

as he also fixed the number of their
gods.

9 For Yahweh’s portion is his people;

Jacob is his apportioned inheritance.
10 He found him in a desert land,

and in the barren and howling wilder-
ness;

he shielded him and cared for him,

he guarded him as the apple of his eye.
11 As an eagle that guards her nest

and flutters over her young,

Yahweh spread out his wings and took
them,

and carried them on his pinions.
12 Yahweh alone led him;

no foreign god was with him.
13 He made him ride on high places of

the land,

and he fed him the fruits of the field;

he nourished him with honey from the
rock,

and oil from the flinty crag.
14He ate butter from the herd and drank

milk from the flock,

with fat of lambs,

rams of Bashan and goats,

with the finest of the wheat—

andyoudrank foamingwinemade from
the juice of grapes.

15 But Jeshurun grew fat and kicked—

you grew fat, you were too fat, and you
had eaten your fill—

he abandoned the God who made him,

and he rejected the Rock of his salva-
tion.

16 They made Yahweh jealous by their
strange gods;

with their abominations they angered
him.

17 They sacrificed to demons, which are
not God—

gods they had not known,

gods that recently appeared,

gods your fathers did not fear.
18 You have deserted the Rock, who be-

came your father,

and you forgot the God who gave you
birth.

19 Yahweh saw this and he rejected
them,

because his sons and his daughters pro-
voked him so.

20 “I will hide my face from them,” he
said,

”and I will see what their end will be;

for they are a perverse generation,

children who are unfaithful.
21 They have made me jealous by what

is not god

and angered me by their worthless
things.

I will make them envious by those who
are not a people;

by a foolish nation I will make them
angry.

22 For a fire is kindled by my anger

and is burning to the lowest Sheol;

it is devouring the earth and its harvest;

it is setting on fire the foundations of
the mountains.
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23 I will heap disasters on them;

I will shoot all my arrows at them;
24 They will be wasted by hunger and

devoured by burning heat

and bitter destruction;

I will send on them the teeth of wild
animals,

with the poison of things that crawl in
the dust.

25 Outside the sword will bereave,

and in the bedrooms terror will do so.

It will destroy both young man and vir-
gin,

the nursing baby, and the man of gray
hairs.

26 I said that I would scatter them far
away,

that I would make the memory of them
to cease from among mankind.

27 Were it not that I feared the provoca-
tion of the enemy,

and that their enemies would judgemis-
takenly,

and that they would say, ‘Our hand is
exalted,’

I would have done all this.
28 For Israel is a nation devoid of wis-

dom,

and there is no understanding in them.
29 Oh, that they were wise, that they

understood this,

that they would consider their coming
fate!

30 How could one chase a thousand,

and two put ten thousand to flight,

unless their Rock had sold them,

and Yahweh had given them up?

31 For our enemies’ rock is not like our
Rock,

just as even our enemies admit.
32 For their vine comes from the vine of

Sodom,

and from the fields of Gomorrah;

their grapes are grapes of poison;

their clusters are bitter.
33 Their wine is the poison of serpents

and the cruel venom of asps.
34 Is not this plan secretly kept by me,

sealed up among my treasures?
35 Vengeance is mine to give, and rec-

ompense,

at the time when their foot slips;

for the day of disaster for them is near,

and the things that are to come on them
will hurry to happen.”

36 For Yahweh will give justice to his
people,

and he will pity his servants.

He will see that their power is gone,

and no one remains, either slaves or
free people.

37 Then he will say, ”Where are their
gods,

the rock in whom they took refuge?—
38 The gods who ate the fat of their sac-

rifices

and drank the wine of their drink offer-
ings?

Let them rise up and help you;

let them be your protection.
39 See now that I, even I, am God,

and that there is no god besides me;

I kill, and I make alive;

I wound, and I heal,
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and there is no one who can save you
from my might.

40 For I lift up my hand to heaven

and say, ’As I live forever, I will act.
41 When I sharpen my glittering sword,

and when my hand begins to bring jus-
tice,

I will render vengeance onmy enemies,

and I will pay back those who hate me.
42 I will make my arrows drunk with

blood,

and my sword will devour flesh

with the blood of the killed and the cap-
tives,

and from the heads of the leaders of the
enemy.’”

43 Rejoice, you nations, with God’s peo-
ple,

for he will avenge the blood of his ser-
vants;

he will render vengeance on his ene-
mies,

andhewillmake atonement for his land,
for his people.
44 Moses came and recited all the words of
this song in the ears of the people, he, and
Joshua son of Nun. 45 ThenMoses finished
reciting all these words to all Israel. 46

He said to them, ”Fix your mind on all the
words that I have witnessed to you today,
so that you may command your children
to keep them, all the words of this law. 47

For this is no trivial matter for you, be-
cause it is your life, and through this thing
youwill prolong your days in the land that
you are going over the Jordan to possess.”
48 Yahweh spoke to Moses on that same
day and said, 49 ”Go up into this range of
themountains of Abarim, upMount Nebo,

which is in the land ofMoab, opposite Jeri-
cho. You will look at the land of Canaan,
which I am giving to the people of Israel
as their possession. 50 You will die on the
mountain that you go up, and you will be
gathered to your people, as Aaron your fel-
low Israelite died on Mount Hor and was
gathered to his people. 51 This will hap-
pen because you were unfaithful to me
among the people of Israel at the waters
of Meribah in Kadesh, in the wilderness
of Sin; because you did not treat me with
honor and respect among the people of Is-
rael. 52 For you will see the land before
you, but you will not go there, into the
land that I am giving to the people of Is-
rael.”

Chapter 33
1 This is the blessingwithwhichMoses the
man of God blessed the people of Israel be-
fore his death. 2 He said:

Yahweh came from Sinai

and rose from Seir upon them.

He shined out from Mount Paran,

and he camewith ten thousands of holy
ones.

In his right hand were flashes of light-
ning.

3 Indeed, he loves the peoples;

all his holy ones are in your hand,

and they bowed down at your feet;

they received your words.
4 Moses commanded us a law,

an inheritance for the assembly of Ja-
cob.

5 Then there was a king in Jeshurun,

when the heads of the people had gath-
ered,
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all the tribes of Israel together.
6 Let Reuben live and not die,

but may his men be few.
7 This is the blessing for Judah. Moses
said:

Listen, Yahweh, to the voice of Judah,

and bring him to his people again.

Fight for him;

be a help against his enemies.
8 About Levi, Moses said:

Your Thummim and your Urim belong
your loyal one,

the one whom you tested at Massah,

with whom you struggled at the waters
of Meribah.

9 The man who said about his father
and mother, “I have not seen them.”

Neither did he acknowledge his broth-
ers,

nor did he take account of his own chil-
dren.

For he guarded your word

and kept your covenant.
10 He teaches Jacob your decrees

and Israel your law.

He will put incense before you

and whole burnt offerings on your al-
tar.

11 Bless, Yahweh, his possessions,

and accept the work of his hands.

Shatter the loins of those who rise up
against him,

and those of the people who hate him,
so that they do not rise up again.
12 About Benjamin, Moses said:

The one loved by Yahweh lives in secu-
rity beside him;

Yahweh shields him all the day long,

and he lives between Yahweh’s arms.
13 About Joseph, Moses said:

May his land be blessed by Yahweh

with the precious things of heaven, with
the dew,

and with the deep that lies beneath.
14 May his land be blessed with the pre-

cious things of the harvest of the sun,

with the precious things of the produce
of the months,

15 with the finest things of the ancient
mountains,

and with the precious things of the ev-
erlasting hills.

16 May his land be blessed with the
precious things of the earth and its abun-
dance,

and with the good will of him who was
in the bush.

Let the blessing come on the head of
Joseph,

and on the top of the head of him who
was prince over his brothers.

17 The firstborn of an ox, majestic is he,

and his horns are the horns of a wild
ox.

With them he will push the peoples, all
of them, to the ends of the earth.

These are the ten thousands of Ephraim;

these are the thousands of Manasseh.
18 About Zebulun, Moses said:

Rejoice, Zebulun, in your going out,

and you, Issachar, in your tents.
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19 Theywill call the peoples to themoun-
tains.

There will they offer sacrifices of righ-
teousness.

For they will suck the abundance of the
seas,

and from the sand on the seashore.
20 About Gad, Moses said:

Blessed be he who enlarges Gad.

He will live there like a lioness,

and he will tear off an arm or a head.
21 He provided the best part for himself,

for there was the leader’s portion of
land reserved.

He came with the heads of the people.

He carried out the justice of Yahweh

and his decrees with Israel.
22 About Dan, Moses said:

Dan is a lion cub

that leaps out from Bashan.
23 About Naphtali, Moses said:

Naphtali, satisfied with favor,

and full of the blessing of Yahweh,

take possession of the land to the west
and south.
24 About Asher, Moses said:

Blessed be Asher more than the other
sons;

let him be acceptable to his brothers,

and let him dip his foot in olive oil.
25 May your city bars be iron and

bronze;

as long as will be your days, so long will
your security be.

26 There is no one like God, Jeshurun—
the upright one,

who rides through the heavens to your
help,

and in his majesty on the clouds.
27 The eternal God is a refuge,

and underneath are the everlasting
arms.

He thrust out the enemy from before
you,

and he said, “Destroy!”
28 Israel dwelt in safety.

Jacob’s spring was secure

in a land of grain and new wine;

indeed, let his heavens drop dew on
him.

29 Your blessings are many, Israel!

Who is like you, a people saved by Yah-
weh,

the shield of your help,

and the sword of your majesty?

Your enemies will come trembling to
you;

you will trample down their high
places.

Chapter 34
1 Moses went up from the plains of Moab
toMount Nebo, to the top of Pisgah, which
is opposite Jericho. There Yahweh showed
him all the land of Gilead as far as Dan, 2
and all Naphtali, and the land of Ephraim
and Manasseh, and all the land of Judah,
to the western sea, 3 and the Negev, and
the plain of the Valley of Jericho, the City
of Palms, as far as Zoar. 4 Yahweh said
to him, “This is the land that I swore to
Abraham, to Isaac, and to Jacob, saying, ‘I
will give it to your descendants.’ I have al-
lowed you to look at it with your eyes, but
youwill not go over there.” 5 SoMoses the
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servant of Yahweh, died there in the land
ofMoab, as theword of Yahweh promised.
6 Yahweh buried him in the valley in the
land of Moab opposite Beth Peor, but no
one knows where his grave is to this day.
7 Moses was one hundred twenty years
oldwhenhe died; his eyewas not dim, nor
his natural force abated. 8 The people of
Israel mourned for Moses in the plains of
Moab for thirty days, and then the days of
mourning for Moses were finished.

9 Joshua son of Nunwas full of the spirit of

wisdom, for Moses had laid his hands on
him. The people of Israel listened to him
and did what Yahweh had commanded
Moses. 10 There has not arisen a prophet
since in Israel like Moses, whom Yahweh
knew face to face. 11 There has never been
any prophet like him in all the signs and
wonders that Yahweh sent him to do in
the land of Egypt, to Pharaoh, and to all
his servants, and to all his land. 12 There
has never been any prophet like him in all
the great, fearsome deeds that Moses did
in the sight of all Israel.
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